Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER 22776
BID OPENING 10/21/2014
GROUP NUMBER 05900

PURCHASING OFFICER  James Patrick

TELEPHONE (518) 408-1026

DESCRIPTION
Natural Gas
(Flrm Supply - Fixed and Indexed Price)
(Interruptible Supply - Indexed Price)
(Statewide)




State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - NYS Procurement (NYSPro)
- Corning Tower - 38" Floor, Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS
IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
WITH THE EXCEPTION OF PRICING WHICH CAN BE FAXED TO 518-486-5628 ONLY
(E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted)

BID OPENING ITLE: Group 05900 ~ NATURAL GAS —r
DATE: October 21, 2014 (FIRM SUPPLY — FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)

TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY ~ INDEXED PRICE)

TFB Number 22776 _|Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMEBER 1, 2014 THRU OCTOBER 31,2016 WITH RENEWALS FOR UP TO AN ADDITIONAL 3 YEARS

DESIGNATED CONTACTS:

PRIMARY CONTACT: - SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick James Jasiewicz

0GS.smPS CM FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny_.gov _ OGS.sm.PS CM FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly execnted by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full keowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard Clauses
For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k (Procurement
Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees -
to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-j (3) and §139-j (6) ).

Additional Procurement Lobhying information may be accessed at: ‘

hgg:f/www.ogs.nx.gov/aboutOgs/reguIaﬁons/defaultSFL 139-k.asp

Bidder’s Federal Tax ldentification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
3 (Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See “Neaw Yark State Vendor File Registration” elatise)

Colspial Enersy Tac.

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street- City State County Zip Code

3915 Fair Ridge Or  Farfas V4. FailFay /1033

if applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate [] NYS Small Business OJ NYS Minority [] NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply): # Employees Owned Business Business

{f applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate [] Manufactured [] Solely Manufactured [] Partially Manufactured
box{es) (check ail that apply): Within NYS - Outside NYS Outside NYS %

1t you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
(7] WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder’s Signature: W Printed or Typed Name: Dauid A—rnd.—!-'

Tide: _ Sr Assk_ Aaalyst+ Date: /01714

Phone; Extension Toll Free Phone: Extension
703 'q / 5 - 3 o ‘/3 Extension Toll Free Fax; Extension

E-mail Address: d,amd-j-&.;a/uiﬁl g,j ergd. o Company Website:
FOR N_EW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY N
[PR.# 22776 LT 0O MEMO [0 LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES [/ X } _[

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID Sy




State of New Yark Executive Department
Office of General Services - NYS Procurement (NYSPro)
Corning Tower - 38" Floor, Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS
IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
WITH THE EXCEPTION OF PRICING WHICH CAN BE FAXED TO 518-486-5628 ONLY
(E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted)

BID OPENING ‘ [TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS

ATE: QOctober 21, 2014 . (FIRM SUPPLY — FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)

TME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY — INDEXED PRICE)
{IFB Number 22776 IClassification Code: 15 Utilities
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: A3 Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids
CONTRACT PERIOD; NOVEMBER 1, 2014 THRU OCTOBER 31, 2016 WITH RENEWAL_S FOR UP TO AN ADDITIONAL 3 YEARS

: ) DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECOMDARY CONTACT:
James Pairick James Jasiewicz

The bid must be fully and properly exccuted by an authorized person, By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yoursell, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS,
State Finance Law §139-] and §139-k (Procurement

Lobbying Law), and thst all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees
to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacty as required by State Finance Law §139-f (3) and §139-j {6) (b).
Adxhlmlul l’rueurement Lobbying information mey be acteused at:

utfons/delay

Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor identification Number:

(Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See "New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
D6 1543530 | | 100008070

Legal Business Namepf Company Bidding:
. )

N %W'Le;fme

[)/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street ' City State County Zip Code
122/ Lanan é’(’ $6.150 Houston Lawiis 77210

{If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate [ ] NYS Small Busmess 1 NYS Minority '[[] NYS Women Owned
thox(es) (check all that apply): # Employees Owned Business Business

I1f applicable, place an “x” in the apptopriate [ Manufactured [} Solely Manufactured E] Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check all that appiy): Within NYS Qutside NYS Outside NYS %

1f yau are not bidding, place an “x™ in the box and return this page only.
[1 WEAREUNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signature: |, Printed or Typed Name: Kﬁ,k Sfa’h&
Tide: ﬁm”z Lonnorts tetef Busrisns Bubanttmmantpse: October 20, 2014
Phone: S0l-2 Extension Toll Free Phone: Extension
2- "I -63t6 Extension Toli Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: Kivie , sfone & Zapsihe{iapdn . Cop Company Website: Lopstrbinhin N7
. FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY / )
FrR.# 22776 LT OO MEMOD LET [0  OTHERDO MISSING PAGES Ny |

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID




WV W L WY F

State of New York Exccutive Depavtment
Office of Generul Svxvices - NYS Procurcment (NYSPro)
Corning Tower - 38" Floor, Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242 ’

INVITATION FOR BIDS
IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
WITH THE EXCEPTION OF PRICING WHICH CAN BE, FAXED T0O 518-4¥6-5628 ONLY
{(E-mail Bid Submissions nre not accepted)

ﬁam OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 — NATURAL GAS
DATE: Octaber 21, 2014 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED FRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number * 22776 Classiflcation Cade: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: Arx Incorporated in the Invitativn For Bids
CONTRACT PERTOD: NOVEMRBER 1, 2014 THRU OCTOBER 31, 2016 WITII RENTWALS FOR UP TO AN ADDITIONAL 3 YEARS

DESIGNATED CONTACTS:

SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Jnsiawiazl

PRIMARY CONTACT:
James Pawrick

[+

8

The bid muat b fully snd properly exécuted hy an authorired person. By signing, you cextify your express wuthority to sign on behalf of
yourself, yotr company, or other entity and fuil knowiedge and #eceptance of thiv INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard Clauses
For New York Stnte Contracts), Appendix I (OGS General Speciiications), and State Mnance Law §139-) and §139-) (Procurement
Toblbying Law}, and that all informntian provided ia complets, triae and sccurate, By signing, Bldder afflrma that it ynderstanda and agl'eeE
fo eomply with tie OGS procedures relative fo pormisstble contacts as required Ly Séate Finance Lav §139-j (3) and §139- (6) {b).
Additionnd Procurement Lobbying information muy by acoessed =i

ttp:/fwvww.ogs by, gov/iubout Oge/veuintons/dolaul tSFT. 139]-k s

Bidder's Federal Tax Idenfificatlon Number: -
(Do Not Use Social Security Number)

NYB Vendor Identification Numbor:
{See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)

/003620

9 1-0663Y36

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
, =L QansT 'Poy._.i-n. ~ Q.\s -

13/R3/A - Doing Buxiness As (if applicable):;
Straot -— : i - Btate County “Zip Code

FYo dhcysag.o Dyer Cﬁ&g&f Ny Ellor-w ¢ oMY
If applicable, place en “x” in the appropriate [ NYS Small Buginess NYS Minority NYS Women Owned
beve(es) (clhieck alf thar apply): # Hrnployses Owned Business Business
Lf applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate [[) Manufactured Solely Manufactured | Parlially Manufuctured
bax{es) (check ull thew applyy: Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

IF you are not bidding, place an *x* in the box and return this page only.
[0 WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signalure; Printed or Typed Name: ¢/ 1o et i Aoty

Titter L0 ~ Date:
Phonu: o Extension Toll Free Phone: o0 - §95 ~ Q/S& Extension
e- Y3 - §1977 Exlension Tolt Free Fax: Lixtension .

5 Compagy Website: o wiva , ET8WD Tty e &
IFOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY . .
O MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGTLY” )
RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID W

I-mail Address; @R it esy

LIT

[PR# 27776

10/21/14 TUE 09:50 [TX/RX No 97941 ooz



State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - NYS Procurement (NYSPro)
Corning Tower - 38" Floer, Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS
IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
WITH THE EXCEPTION OF PRICING WHICH CAN BE FAXED TO 518-486-5628 ONLY
(E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted)

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS
DATE: October 21, 2014 (FIRM SUPPLY ~ FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY — INDEXED PRICE)

Classification Code: 15 Utilities
As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

IFB Number 22776
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:

CONTRACT PERIOCD: NOVEMBER 1,2014 THRU OCTORER 31,2016 WITH RENEWALS FOR UP TO AN ADDITIONAL 3 YEARS
' DESIGNATED CONTACTS:

SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Jasiewicz
QGS.smPS CM_FlectFuelRoads@oss.ny,

PRIMARY CONTACT:
James Patrick
0GS.sm.PS CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an antherized persen. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard Clauses
For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k (Procurement

Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees -
to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-j (3) and §139-j (6) (b).

Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:
hitp:/fwww,ogs.uy.gov/aboutQgs/regalations/defaniSFL 139-k, as

' Bidder’s-Federal Tax Ydeptification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:

: (Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
8005010 s 10000 342§
egal Business Name of Company Bidding:
EnerayMack LLC

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable): -

Streetégss Ma,'n S‘h"ﬂe"" Cityu“‘-‘msu‘”‘State U\_{

T NYS Small Business

Coun -
Y Erie
NYS Minority

Zip Code I"IJJ-‘

]j NYS Women Qwned

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate

box(es) (check ail that apply): # Emplbyecs Owned Business Business
{If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate ] Manufactured Solely Manufactured Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check ail that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

[f you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
[] WEAREUNABLEIO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

A L
Bidder’s Signaturcj_')ﬁao?ﬁ/ r //\a!C/hf(hef

Printed or Typed Name: Ga_{*s A M W‘CJ\I 'ol‘a‘

Title: Proerdend

Date: }O [a.0 1Y

Phone: "1 - p ~f-1go0 Extension Toll Free Phone: Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax: . Extension
E-mail Address: . Corm _ Company Website: . et L & Com
R NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
| P.R.# 22776 LIT OO0 MEMO 1 LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES A\ / ]
RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID N



State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - NYS Procurement (NYSPro)
Corning Tower - 38" Floor, Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS
TMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
WITH THE EXCEPTION OF PRICING WHICH CAN BE FAXED TO 518-486-5628 ONLY
(E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted)

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 — NATURAL GAS

DATE: - October 21, 2014 (FIRM SUPPLY — FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUFPTIBLE SUPPLY — INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 22776 Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation Fer Bids

DESIGNATED CONTACTS:

CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2014 THRU OCTOBER 31, 2016 WITH RENEWALS FOR UP TO AN ADDITIONAL 3 YEARS

PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick James Jasiewicz
0GS8.sm PS_CM _FleetFuelRpads@ogs.ny.gov ’ 0GS.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ops.ny.pov

The bid must be fuily and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you eertify your express authority to sign on behalf of

yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard Clauses

For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-f and §139-k (Procurement

Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees -

to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-j (3) and §1392-j (6) (b).
Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at; .

hitp://www.ozs.ny.gov/aboutQgs/regulations/defanltSFL _139j-k.asp

F NYS Vender Identification:Number;
(Do N ogial 1 EEAA
/G- /908956 /000075905

(o¢e "New York State Vendor File Registration” ;ﬁ.‘fqﬁ%j

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: .
Atitional Feel ”Re}‘oarge{_ fac

ID/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code

168 Lawrence “Bell T+, Suke 29 Gfillansvdle A F £ry /922)
If applicable, place an “x™ in the appropriate [] NYS Small Business [] NYS Minority [] NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply): ’ # Employees Owned Business Business

If applicable, place an “x™ in the appropriate [} Manufactured ] Solely Manufactured | Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check alt that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

[f you are not bidding, place an “x™ in the box and return this page only.
[] WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder’s Signature, ) , 4 4 7. MM rinted or Typed Name: Josgoh A 2&/ Vecehio

Title: Viee “Brefsdert @ Date: !b} 7 I 201t
Phone: 7/6- §3u-4700 Extension =" Toll Free Phone: ( 5’09) £39- 9992 Extension
For  P/6- €30-6057 Extension Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: G(C:'Zéc‘ou,‘c,l.,aﬂﬁ:/‘/’(',o €1 Company Website: fomins, nfrrnc . Cam
FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY A\
[PR# 22776 LT O MEMOW LET O OIHERDTI  MISSING PAGES || (V) ]

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID ORNO-BID  \\ /



State of New York Executive Department
Office of General Services - NYS Procurement (NYSPro)
Corning Tower - 38™ Floor, Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

WITH THE EXCEPTION OF PRICING WHICH CAN BE FAXED TO 518-486-5628 ONLY

(E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted)

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS
DATE: October 21, 2014 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 22776 Classification Code: 15 Utilities
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids
(CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2014 THRU OCTOBER 31, 2016 WITH RENEWALS FOR UP TO AN ADDITIONAL 3 YEARS

. DESIGNATED CONTACTS:

PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick James Jasiewicz
0GS.sm.PS CM _FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny,gov OGS sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRcads@ops ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A (Standard Clauses
For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k (Procurement
Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees
to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-j (3) and §139-j (6) (b).
Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:

http://www.ogs.ny.gov/aboutQOgs/regulations/defaultSFL, 139i-k.as

Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Namber; NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) ‘ {See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)

Logal Busi N fC Bidding: ;
e ™ Plymouth Rock Enecgy LLC

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street

[T}

if applicable, place an “x” in
box(es) (check all that apply):

Cit State Count Zip Code
1074 Rvuedway mefe NY OSSG1 H59¢
propriate ] NYS Small Business NYS Minority [] NYS Women Owned
# Employees Owned Business Business

box(es) (check all that apply):

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate [] Manufactured O Solely Manufactured M Partially Manufactured

Within NYS Qutside NYS _ Outside NYS %

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
[] WEAREUNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Title: gb\ Dplu

Bidder’s Signature: M{ % ¢ Printed or Typed Name: Ke\fin E Cj@l?\nﬂhﬁ
Oyl pue: |00 -0

Phone: S i G "2‘—_?/‘:) 50“?_/

Extension Toll Free Phone: Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax; Extension

@ n' Ly ﬁu‘”ﬂ ENeXe , LoA-0mpany Website: pl‘jm "*u'“q €viegsy. CONI

[E-mail Address: K@q@_e,man
—

FOR'NEW YORISSYATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY /%,

[ P.R.# 22776 LT O

MEMO O LET O  OTHERO MISSING PAGES\Q} ]

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID




State of New York Executive Depiartment
Office of General Services - NYS Procurement (NYSPro)
Corning Tower - 38" Floor, Empire State Plaza
Albany, NY 12242

INVITATION FOR BIDS
IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
WITH THE EXCEPTION OF PRICING WHICH CAN BE FAXED TO 518-486-5628 ONLY
(E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted)

BID OPENING ITITLE: Group 05200 — NATURAL GAS
BATE: Qctober 21,2014 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY — INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 22776 Classification Code: 15 Utilities
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: IAs Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids
CONTRACT PERIOD: NOVEMBER 1, 2014 THRU OCTORER 31, 2016 WITH RENEWALS FOR UP TO AN ADDITIONAL 3 YEARS
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick James Jasiewicz
0GS.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov OGS.sm.PS_CM FleetFueiRoads@ogs.ny.gov

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on behalf of
yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATTION FOR BIDS, Appendix A {(Standard Clauses
For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and §139-k (Procurement
Lobbying Law), and that all information providéd is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees
to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State Finance Law §139-j (3) and §139-j (6) (b). -
Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:

httn:/fwww.ogs.ny.gov/aboutOgs/regulations/defaultSFL,_13%{-kasp

Bidder’s Federal Tax Identification Numiber: . INYS \-"i;nd.nr Identification Number:
Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See “New York State Vendor File Registration ™ claise)
&/—= /DesIs~ 7 /O 0o /8394

[Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

S"la—ng E/I(qu (\Df"pﬁf‘q'/,ﬂ.‘-\
e v

ID/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

- |Street . . ) City | ¢ State County | Zip Code
1677 C(”P&J.al S'f: C/’?C«'N‘K-‘!Jl O/{/ %fﬂﬂ/)ld-’l ‘Z{D?-CO ‘i)
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate [[] NYS Small Business [} NYS Minority NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply): # Employees Owned Business Business

fif applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate ] Manufactured W Solely Manufactured H Partially Manufactured

ibox(es) (check alf that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS QOuiside NYS %

[f you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only. -

3 WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS 1?&5’ E: _ .-

S .
idder’s Signature//% > Ll;'rinted or Typed Name: [/ 4 gy S0 g

Title: E;(P(-\._J,;,p ! { :{"f }ofPS; j{)ﬂ)’ ate: /52/6 i

{Phone: 573 G M3 Extension Toll Free Phone: gqier- 539 ~ 2oy ¢, Extension
$9B A58 Extension Tol Free Fax: 373 -Gar- 3773 Extension

E-mail Address: e gy (2 Sharde pergsy . con  Company Website:  wuw i adpnera s con
FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY SN
[ PR.# 22776 _LIT 0 MEMODO LET O~ OTHERO _ MISSINGPAGES [ 0 )

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID ORNO-BID  \ \ Y




Group 05900 - Natural Gas (Firm Supply - Fixed and Indexed Price)
(Interruptible Supply - Indexed Price)
BID OPENING 10-21-14

BID RESULTS
Constillation | East Coast

LOT Colonial | Energy Gas |Power & Gas| EnergyMark National Fuel Plymouth Stand Energy
NUMBER [ UTILITY TERRITORY TYPE OF SUPPLY Energy Choice Inc. LLC LLC Resources Inc. | Rock Energy Corp.
LOT -1 [Central Hudson Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 7.0909 | $  5.9803
LOT -2 |Central Hudson Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 3.0792 |$ 21818
LOT -3 |Central Hudson Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ 3.6170 $  2.3588
LOT -4 |Consolidated Edison Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 58059 [$ 5.3911 $ 4.6820
LOT -5 |Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 16021 $ 0.7710
LOT -6 |Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 01283 |$ 1.6021 $ 0.4130
LOT -7 |Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ 0.3655 $ 1.7066 $ 0.5720
LOT -8 [National Fuel Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 5.0255 $ 3.9200 | $ 4.0890 | $ 5.5990
LOT-9 [National Fuel Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 5.0233 $ 3.5600 | $ 2.9900 | $ 5.6470
LOT -10 [National Fuel Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ (0.1500)| $ (0.0930)| $ 1.3610
LOT -11 |National Fuel Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ (0.6900)| $ (1.0060)| $ 1.4690
LOT -12 [National Fuel Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ (0.7000)| $ (0.9710)
LOT - 13 |National Grid (East Gate) |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 3.6950 | $ 3.9680
LOT - 14 [National Grid (East Gate) [Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ (0.0730)
LOT - 15 ([National Grid (East Gate) |Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ (0.8732)
LOT - 16 |[National Grid (West Gate) |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 3.7800 | $ 32140 | $ 3.8270
LOT - 17 [National Grid (West Gate) |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ (0.0700)| $ (0.4570)| $ 0.0630
LOT - 18 [National Grid (West Gate) |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ (0.1600)| $ (0.6630)| $ 0.0630
LOT -19 [National Grid (West Gate) |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ (0.8587) $ (0.3500)| $ (0.8730)
LOT -20 [National Grid (West Gate) |Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ (0.5200)| $ (0.2900)| $ (0.1010)
LOT - 21 [National Grid (Long Island)|Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 57243 1%  5.9690 $ 4.4800
LOT -22 |[National Grid (Metro) Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 59829 [$  5.9690 $ 4.5790
LOT - 23 [National Grid (Metro) Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 22144 $ 0.9270
LOT -24 |[National Grid (Metro) Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ 27022 $ 1.2570
LOT - 25 |NY State Electric & Gas  |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 4.4220 $ 4.3200
LOT -26 |[NY State Electric & Gas  |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 3.6480 $ 3.3500 | $ 3.0810 $ 4.1600
LOT - 27 |NY State Electric & Gas  |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 5.0500 | $ 3.9640
LOT -28 [NY State Electric & Gas  |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 3.6360
LOT -29 [NY State Electric & Gas  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 1.0800 | $ 0.7770 $ 0.4950
LOT -30 [NY State Electric & Gas  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ (0.3800)| $ (0.4990)
LOT -31 [NY State Electric & Gas  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 0.7790 $ (0.7000)| $ (0.8500) $ 0.3500
LOT - 32 [NY State Electric & Gas  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 1.5881
LOT -33 |NY State Electric & Gas  |Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ 1.1000 | $ 0.4900 $ 0.6500
LOT -34 |[NY State Electric & Gas  |Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ (0.5900) $ (0.3900)
LOT -35 |NY State Electric & Gas  |Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ (0.9000)| $ (0.9440) $ (0.3400)
LOT -36 |[NY State Electric & Gas |Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ (0.9100) $ (0.9400) $ (0.3400)
LOT - 37 [NY State Electric & Gas [Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply
LOT - 38 |Orange & Rockland Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 59551 [$  4.9869 $ 5.3930
LOT -39 |Orange & Rockland Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $ 0.1793 $ 1.2343
LOT -40 [Orange & Rockland Indexed Price - Firm Supply (utility interruptible) $ 1.1322
LOT - 41 |Rochester Gas & Electric |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $ 5.5248 $ 3.6700 | $ 3.4820
LOT - 42 |Rochester Gas & Electric  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 2.9039 $ (0.4500)| $ (0.0150)
LOT - 43 |St. Lawrence Gas & Elec [Indexed Price - Firm Supply
LOT - 44 |St. Lawrence Gas & Elec  [Indexed Price - Firm Supply
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