












































Item 

Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

Heritagenergy 3.1976$                  

Mansfield Oil Company 3.0986$                  

Mirabito 3.0782$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.1383$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1431$                  

Mirabito 3.2182$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2183$                  

3 Albany 6-MT (.5%) Sprague 3.0942$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.7432$                  

Mirabito 3.6531$                  

Mansfield Oil Company 3.2004$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.1554$                  

Superior Plus 3.1353$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.2170$                  

Sprague 3.1213$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.0973$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.2970$                  

Naughton Energy Corp. 3.6775$                  

Sprague 3.2013$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.1270$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.1360$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 2.8893$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 2.9860$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 2.6552$                  

James River Solutions 3.2003$                  

Mansfield Oil Company 3.1720$                  

Mirabito 3.1342$                  

Superior Plus 3.1393$                  

James River Solutions 3.2003$                  

Mirabito 3.2680$                  

Superior Plus 3.2392$                  

Mirabito 3.7344$                  

Superior Plus 3.6590$                  

Mansfield Oil Company 3.1912$                  

Mirabito 3.1454$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.1554$                  

Superior Plus 3.1354$                  

Allegany 2-MT

1 Albany 2-MT

2 Albany 2-TW

12 Broome KERO (Heating)

13

BID RESULTS  IFB 22779
Heating Fuel Oil

10 Broome 2-MT

11 Broome 2-TW

8 Bronx 4-MT (0.15%) NYC B2

9 Bronx 6-MT (0.3%) NYC B2

6 Bronx 2-MT NYC B2

7 Bronx 2-TW NYC B2

4 Albany KERO (Heating)

5

Cattaraugus 2-MT
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Item 

Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2554$                  

Superior Plus 3.3004$                  

James River Solutions 3.2113$                  

Mirabito 3.1472$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.1993$                  

Superior Plus 3.1593$                  

James River Solutions 3.2203$                  

Mirabito 3.3048$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2993$                  

Superior Plus 3.2792$                  

17 Cayuga KERO (Heating) Mirabito 3.7566$                  

Mirabito 3.2229$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.1554$                  

Superior Plus 3.1354$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2554$                  

Superior Plus 3.2854$                  

Mirabito 3.1857$                  

Superior Plus 3.1293$                  

21 Chemung 2-TW Superior Plus 3.3792$                  

22 Chenango 2-TW Mirabito 3.4370$                  

23 Chenango KERO (Heating) Mirabito 3.7388$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.0622$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.1063$                  

Sprague 3.1902$                  

Superior Plus 3.0733$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.2622$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.3063$                  

Superior Plus 3.1984$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.6222$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.6563$                  

Superior Plus 3.6632$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2022$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.3284$                  

Miller-Wilkins 3.4566$                  

Mirabito 3.2545$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.1966$                  

14 Cattaraugus 2-TW

15 Cayuga 2-MT

19 Chautauqua 2-TW

20 Chemung 2-MT

16 Cayuga 2-TW

18 Chautauqua 2-MT

26 Clinton KERO (Heating)

27 Columbia 2-MT

24 Clinton 2-MT

25 Clinton 2-TW
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

Heritagenergy 3.2797$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.3737$                  

Miller-Wilkins 3.5566$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.2416$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 4.1614$                  

Miller-Wilkins 3.9614$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.7614$                  

Mirabito 3.3258$                  

Superior Plus 3.2542$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2976$                  

Mirabito 3.1033$                  

Sprague 3.0876$                  

32 Delaware 2-TW Mirabito 3.3526$                  

33 Delaware 2-TW B5 Mirabito 3.5105$                  

34 Delaware KERO (Heating) Mirabito 3.7855$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2055$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2022$                  

James River Solutions 3.3256$                  

Mirabito 3.2781$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.1566$                  

Sprague 3.2586$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2755$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2797$                  

James River Solutions 3.3286$                  

Mirabito 3.5298$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.2116$                  

37 Dutchess 2-TW B2 Mirabito 3.7901$                  

38 Dutchess 2-TW B5 Mirabito 3.7838$                  

39 Dutchess 6-MT (0.5%) Sprague 3.1381$                  

Mirabito 3.2104$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.1754$                  

Superior Plus 3.1254$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2354$                  

Superior Plus 3.1838$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.1122$                  

Mirabito 3.1464$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.1188$                  

Sprague 3.1154$                  

Superior Plus 3.0833$                  

30 Cortland 2-TW

31 Delaware 2-MT

28 Columbia 2-TW

29 Columbia KERO (Heating)

40 Erie 2-MT

41 Erie 2-TW

35 Dutchess 2-MT

36 Dutchess 2-TW

42 Essex 2-MT
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.3188$                  

Superior Plus 3.2205$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.6688$                  

Superior Plus 3.6632$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.0622$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.1200$                  

Sprague 3.2172$                  

Superior Plus 3.0883$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.2022$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.3203$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.5992$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.6749$                  

Mirabito 3.1584$                  

Superior Plus 3.1186$                  

49 Fulton 2-TW Superior Plus 3.2736$                  

50 Fulton 4-MT (.5%) Sprague 3.3795$                  

51 Fulton KERO (Heating) Superior Plus 3.6390$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2354$                  

Superior Plus 3.2538$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2022$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.3226$                  

Miller-Wilkins 3.4566$                  

Mirabito 3.3346$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.2566$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2797$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.3515$                  

Miller-Wilkins 3.5566$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.3266$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.8961$                  

Miller-Wilkins 4.2961$                  

56 Greene 6-MT (0.5%) Sprague 3.1540$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 4.1614$                  

Miller-Wilkins 4.1614$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.8144$                  

58 Hamilton 2-MT Mirabito 3.1683$                  

59 Hamilton 2-TW

60 Hamilton KERO (Heating)

NO BID

NO BID

44 Essex KERO (Heating)

45 Franklin 2-MT

43 Essex 2-TW

48 Fulton 2-MT

52 Genesee 2-TW

46 Franklin 2-TW

47 Franklin KERO (Heating)

55 Greene 2-TW B5

57 Greene KERO (Heating)

53 Greene 2-MT

54 Greene 2-TW
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

Mirabito 3.1674$                  

Superior Plus 3.1236$                  

Mirabito 3.3284$                  

Superior Plus 3.3236$                  

63 Herkimer KERO (Heating) Mirabito 3.6735$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.1522$                  

Mirabito 3.2075$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.1452$                  

Superior Plus 3.1236$                  

65 Jefferson 2-TW Superior Plus 3.2836$                  

66 Jefferson KERO (Heating) Superior Plus 3.7390$                  

67 Kings 2-MT United Metro Energy Corp 3.2827$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.2170$                  

Sprague 3.1313$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.0935$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.2970$                  

Naughton Energy Corp. 3.6775$                  

Sprague 3.2313$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.1270$                  

70 Kings 6-MT (0.3%) NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp 2.6553$                  

71 Lewis 2-TW Superior Plus 3.3036$                  

Mirabito 3.1910$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.1754$                  

Superior Plus 3.1354$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2554$                  

Superior Plus 3.2188$                  

Mirabito 3.3351$                  

Superior Plus 3.2886$                  

Mirabito 3.1910$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2554$                  

Superior Plus 3.1788$                  

Mirabito 3.1865$                  

Superior Plus 3.1186$                  

77 Montgomery 2-TW Superior Plus 3.2736$                  

78 Montgomery KERO (Heating) NO BID

64 Jefferson 2-MT

68 Kings 2-MT NYC B2

61 Herkimer 2-MT

62 Herkimer 2-TW

73 Livingston 2-TW

74 Madison 2-TW

69 Kings 2-TW NYC B2

72 Livingston 2-MT

75 Monroe 2-TW

76 Montgomery 2-MT
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.2200$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2880$                  

NIC Holding 3.5003$                  

PAPCO, INC. 3.3078$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.2387$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.3400$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.3280$                  

NIC Holding 3.5503$                  

PAPCO, INC. 3.4028$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.2627$                  

81 New York 2-MT United Metro Energy Corp 3.2577$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.2170$                  

Sprague 3.1313$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.0985$                  

Naughton Energy Corp. 3.6775$                  

Sprague 3.2313$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.1270$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.1360$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 2.8385$                  

85 Niagara 2-TW NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2554$                  

Mirabito 3.1731$                  

Superior Plus 3.1086$                  

Mirabito 3.2620$                  

Superior Plus 3.2236$                  

Mirabito 3.6502$                  

Superior Plus 3.5390$                  

Mirabito 3.2731$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2586$                  

Superior Plus 3.2285$                  

Mirabito 3.6501$                  

Superior Plus 3.6390$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2554$                  

Superior Plus 3.2238$                  

92 Ontario KERO (Heating) Superior Plus 4.1520$                  

79 Nassau 2-MT

80 Nassau 2-TW

84 New York 4-MT (0.15%) NYC B2

86 Oneida 2-MT

82 New York 2-MT NYC B2

83 New York 2-TW NYC B2

89 Onondaga 2-TW

90 Onondaga KERO (Heating)

87 Oneida 2-TW

88 Oneida KERO (Heating)

91 Ontario 2-TW
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2005$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2022$                  

James River Solutions 3.3356$                  

Mirabito 3.2677$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.1616$                  

Sprague 3.2868$                  

Ultra Power Corp. 3.2423$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2743$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2797$                  

James River Solutions 3.3726$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.3716$                  

Mirabito 3.4177$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.2256$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.6961$                  

Mirabito 3.6838$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2554$                  

Superior Plus 3.2538$                  

97 Orleans 6-MT (.5%)

98 Orleans KERO (Heating) Superior Plus 4.1520$                  

Mirabito 3.1879$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2186$                  

Superior Plus 3.1186$                  

Mirabito 3.2931$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2986$                  

Superior Plus 3.2285$                  

Mirabito 3.6723$                  

Superior Plus 3.6390$                  

102 Otsego 2-MT Mirabito 3.0699$                  

103 Otsego 2-TW Mirabito 3.3211$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2005$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2220$                  

Mirabito 3.2754$                  

Singer Energy Group LLC 3.3565$                  

Sprague 3.2923$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2768$                  

Heritagenergy 3.3404$                  

Mirabito 3.4514$                  

Singer Energy Group LLC 3.4065$                  

106 Putnam 2-TW B5 Mirabito 3.7439$                  

NO BID

94 Orange 2-TW

95 Orange 2-TW B5

93 Orange 2-MT

100 Oswego 2-TW

101 Oswego KERO (Heating)

96 Orleans 2-TW

99 Oswego 2-MT

104 Putnam 2-MT

105 Putnam 2-TW
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.2260$                  

PAPCO, INC. 3.1032$                  

Sprague 3.1513$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.0935$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.3760$                  

Naughton Energy Corp. 3.6775$                  

Sprague 3.2513$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.1270$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1779$                  

Mirabito 3.1971$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2183$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.7432$                  

Mirabito 3.6521$                  

111 Richmond 2-TW United Metro Energy Corp 3.4067$                  

112 Richmond 2-TW B2 United Metro Energy Corp 3.4080$                  

113 Richmond 2-TW NYC B2 United Metro Energy Corp 3.1675$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2055$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2220$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2755$                  

Heritagenergy 3.3401$                  

James River Solutions 3.3726$                  

116 Rockland 6-MT (0.3%)

Adirondack Energy 3.0922$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.1249$                  

Superior Plus 3.0883$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.2922$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.3249$                  

Superior Plus 3.2083$                  

Adirondack Energy 3.6222$                  

MX Petroleum Corp 3.6749$                  

Superior Plus 3.6732$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2200$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1271$                  

Mirabito 3.0773$                  

Sprague 3.0701$                  

Superior Plus 3.0783$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1819$                  

Mirabito 3.2426$                  

Superior Plus 3.2055$                  

NO BID

107 Queens 2-MT NYC B2

108 Queens 2-TW NYC B2

114 Rockland 2-MT

115 Rockland 2-TW

109 Rensselaer 2-TW

110 Rensselaer KERO (Heating)

119 St Lawrence KERO (Heating)

120 Saratoga 2-MT

117 St Lawrence 2-MT

118 St Lawrence 2-TW

121 Saratoga 2-TW
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

Mirabito 3.7067$                  

Superior Plus 3.7632$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1271$                  

Mirabito 3.0643$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.1383$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1819$                  

Mirabito 3.1981$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2183$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1468$                  

Mirabito 3.0685$                  

Superior Plus 3.0783$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.2012$                  

Mirabito 3.2861$                  

Superior Plus 3.2554$                  

James River Solutions 3.2463$                  

Mirabito 3.3926$                  

Superior Plus 3.4292$                  

James River Solutions 3.1963$                  

Mirabito 3.1904$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2093$                  

Superior Plus 3.1393$                  

James River Solutions 3.1963$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2993$                  

Superior Plus 3.2292$                  

130 Seneca KERO (Heating) Superior Plus 3.7790$                  

James River Solutions 3.1963$                  

Superior Plus 3.3292$                  

132 Steuben KERO (Heating) Superior Plus 3.8790$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.3280$                  

NIC Holding 3.4703$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.2427$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.4180$                  

NIC Holding 3.5503$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.2577$                  

123 Schenectady 2-MT

124 Schenectady 2-TW

122 Saratoga KERO (Heating)

127 Schuyler 2-TW

128 Seneca 2-MT

125 Schoharie 2-MT

126 Schoharie 2-TW

133 Suffolk 2-MT

134 Suffolk 2-TW

129 Seneca 2-TW

131 Steuben 2-TW
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

County Petroleum 3.3250$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2183$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2022$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.3461$                  

Mirabito 3.2672$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.1766$                  

Sprague 3.2716$                  

Ultra Power Corp. 3.2423$                  

County Petroleum 3.3950$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2780$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2797$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.4341$                  

Mirabito 3.4289$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.3266$                  

Ultra Power Corp. 3.2823$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.7711$                  

Mirabito 3.6837$                  

County Petroleum 3.8614$                  

Mirabito 3.8725$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.8114$                  

Ultra Power Corp. 3.5148$                  

James River Solutions 3.1963$                  

Mirabito 3.1667$                  

Superior Plus 3.1313$                  

James River Solutions 3.1963$                  

Mirabito 3.3038$                  

Superior Plus 3.2592$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2104$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2022$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.3226$                  

Mirabito 3.2664$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.1566$                  

Sprague 3.2659$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2768$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2797$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.3526$                  

Mirabito 3.4510$                  

Morgan Fuel 3.2116$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.6361$                  

Mirabito 3.6960$                  

144 Ulster 6-MT (0.5%) Sprague 3.1342$                  

137 Sullivan 2-TW B5

138 Sullivan KERO (Heating)

135 Sullivan 2-MT

136 Sullivan 2-TW

141 Ulster 2-MT

142 Ulster 2-TW

139 Tioga 2-MT

140 Tompkins 2-TW

143 Ulster 2-TW B5
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Number
County Fuel Type Bidder  Bid Price  

Heritagenergy 3.2222$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1281$                  

Mirabito 3.1003$                  

Sprague 3.0942$                  

146 Warren 2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.2052$                  

147 Warren KERO (Heating) Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.8132$                  

Heritagenergy 3.2222$                  

Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1281$                  

Mirabito 3.0920$                  

Sprague 3.0860$                  

149 Washington 2-TW Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.1952$                  

150 Washington 6-MT (0.5%) Sprague 3.1263$                  

151 Washington KERO (Heating) Main Brothers Oil Co,Inc 3.8132$                  

NOCO Energy Corp. 3.2554$                  

Superior Plus 3.2438$                  

153 Wayne KERO (Heating) Superior Plus 4.2320$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.1460$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2105$                  

James River Solutions 3.3316$                  

PAPCO, INC. 3.2357$                  

Singer Energy Group LLC 3.3065$                  

Sprague 3.3254$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.2327$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.2660$                  

Global Montello Group Corp. 3.2755$                  

James River Solutions 3.3316$                  

Naughton Energy Corp. 3.8566$                  

Singer Energy Group LLC 3.3565$                  

Sprague 3.4004$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.2710$                  

East Coast Petroleum Inc. 3.1860$                  

James River Solutions 3.3151$                  

United Metro Energy Corp 3.2775$                  

157 Wyoming KERO (Heating)

158 Yates 2-TW NOCO Energy Corp. 3.3593$                  

NO BID

148 Washington 2-MT

152 Wayne 2-TW

145 Warren 2-MT

156 Westchester 2-TW B5

154 Westchester 2-MT

155 Westchester 2-TW
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