




















22945 Transit Buses Bid Summary

Bidder (#) Bidder Name

LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom 

Wagon <10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

4 Passenger 

[3A/1WC]

7 Passenger 

[6A/1WC]

7 Passenger 

[6A/1WC]

9 Passenger 

[8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Bid Summary Alliance Bus Group Inc. $1,606,000.00 No Bid No Bid $3,274,740.00 $3,389,310.00 $5,707,400.00 $10,132,125.00 $7,183,250.00 $3,043,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (2) Don Brown Bus Sales, Inc. No Bid $2,555,175.00 No Bid $3,379,740.00 $3,419,700.00 No Bid $10,438,175.00 $8,646,850.00 $3,129,717.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (3) EMPIRE BUS SALES, LLC $1,740,880.00 No Bid No Bid $3,611,640.00 No Bid No Bid $11,387,755.00 $8,039,825.00 $3,043,051.00 No Bid No Bid $5,154,535.00 $7,145,880.00

Bid Summary (4) Fenton Mobility Products Inc. No Bid $2,812,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (5) Matthews Buses Inc. $1,590,800.00 No Bid No Bid $3,421,365.00 $3,491,745.00 No Bid $10,198,025.00 $7,205,950.00 $2,811,415.00 $2,450,315.00 $7,392,690.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (6) New Flyer of America Inc. (30 Foot) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,563,834.80

Bid Summary (7) New Flyer of America Inc. (35 Foot) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,773,449.60

Bid Summary (8) Rohrer Bus No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,351,430.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (9) Shepard Bros., Inc. $1,589,960.80 No Bid $1,980,920.00 $3,122,088.00 $3,232,080.00 No Bid $9,826,035.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (10) W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, INC. No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,579,041.25 $3,657,773.85 No Bid $11,272,730.70 $7,553,203.00 $2,926,240.76 $2,458,969.75 $7,465,504.20 No Bid No Bid

Bid Rank Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name

1 $1,589,960.80 Shepard Bros., Inc. $2,555,175.00 Don Brown Bus 

Sales, Inc.

$1,980,920.00 Shepard Bros., Inc. $3,122,088.00 Shepard Bros., Inc. $3,232,080.00 Shepard Bros., Inc. $5,351,430.00 Rohrer Bus $9,826,035.00 Shepard Bros., Inc.

2 $1,590,800.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $2,812,150.00 Fenton Mobility 

Products Inc. 

$3,274,740.00 Alliance Bus Group 

Inc.

$3,389,310.00 Alliance Bus Group 

Inc.

$5,707,400.00 Alliance Bus Group 

Inc.

$10,132,125.00 Alliance Bus Group 

Inc.

3 $1,606,000.00 Alliance Bus Group 

Inc.

$3,379,740.00 Don Brown Bus 

Sales, Inc.

$3,419,700.00 Don Brown Bus 

Sales, Inc.

$10,198,025.00 Matthews Buses Inc.

4 $1,740,880.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

$3,421,365.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $3,491,745.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $10,438,175.00 Don Brown Bus 

Sales, Inc.

5 $3,579,041.25 W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, 

INC.

$3,657,773.85 W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, 

INC.

$11,272,730.70 W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, 

INC.

6 $3,611,640.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

$11,387,755.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

Bid Rank Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name

1 $7,183,250.00 Alliance Bus Group 

Inc.

$2,811,415.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $2,450,315.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $7,392,690.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $5,154,535.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

$6,563,834.80 New Flyer of America 

Inc. (30 Foot)

2 $7,205,950.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $2,926,240.76 W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, 

INC.

$2,458,969.75 W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, 

INC.

$7,465,504.20 W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, 

INC.

$6,773,449.60 New Flyer of America 

Inc. (35 Foot)

3 $7,553,203.00 W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, 

INC.

$3,043,051.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

$7,145,880.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

4 $8,039,825.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

$3,043,600.00 Alliance Bus Group 

Inc.

5 $8,646,850.00 Don Brown Bus 

Sales, Inc.

$3,129,717.00 Don Brown Bus 

Sales, Inc.

LOT H

DRW Cutaway >22 ft. (Alternate Fuels)

16 Passenger [14A/2WC]

Grand Total For Lot

LOT A

Low Floor Vehicle <10,000 lb.

4 Passenger [3A/1WC]

LOT D

Dual Rear Wheel Cutaway <22 ft.

9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

LOT E LOT G

Dual Rear Wheel Cutaway >22 ft.

16 Passenger [14A/2WC]

LOT B

High Headroom Wagon <10,000 lb.

LOT C

Single Rear Wheel Cutaway

7 Passenger [6A/1WC]

Dual Rear Wheel Cutaway <22 ft.

11 Passenger [10A/1WC]

LOT K

Conventional Style

28 Passenger [26A/2WC]

LOT L

7 Passenger [6A/1WC]

LOT I

20 Passenger [18A/2WC]

Medium Duty Cutaway 

LOT J

Conventional Style 

24 Passenger [22A/2WC]

Low Floor (Front Engine)

25 Passenger [23A/2WC]

LOT F

Low Floor Cutaway

17 Passenger [15A/2WC]

LOT M

Low Floor (Rear Engine)

35  Passenger [33A/2WC]



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

Alliance Bus Group Inc.

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
YES NO NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO NO NO NO

Chassis Model Year 2016 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab 2016 2016 2016 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Mobility Ventures LLC Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Ford Ford Chevy Ford Chevrolet Ford Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model MV-1 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab E350 E350 Express 4500 GM Cutaway E450 C4500 F550 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code DX Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab E3F E3F CG33803 E4F CG33903 F5G Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year 2016 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab 2016 2016 2016 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Mobility Ventures LLC Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Startrans Startrans Arboc SV Startrans Startrans Startrans Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model MV-1 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Senator II Senator II Spirit of Mobility Senator II Senator II Senator HD Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code DX Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab 69921 69933 Enter on LOT F tab 69928 69907 79904 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price $39,950.00 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab $52,100.00 $53,900.00 $127,900.00 $58,500.00 $68,500.00 $87,000.00 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price $8,000.00 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab $148,740.00 $155,310.00 $591,400.00 $1,357,125.00 $333,250.00 $433,600.00 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot $1,606,000.00 No Bid No Bid $3,274,740.00 $3,389,310.00 $5,707,400.00 $10,132,125.00 $7,183,250.00 $3,043,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

Don Brown Bus Sales, Inc.

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
NO YES NO YES YES NO YES YES YES NO NO NO NO

Chassis Model Year Enter on LOT A tab 2016 Enter on LOT C tab 2016 2016 Enter on LOT F tab 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Enter on LOT A tab Ford Enter on LOT C tab Ford Ford Enter on LOT F tab Ford General Motors Ford Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Enter on LOT A tab Long Wheelbase Enter on LOT C tab E350 E350 Enter on LOT F tab E450 4500 F550 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT A tab X2X Enter on LOT C tab E3F E3F Enter on LOT F tab E4F 33803 F5G Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year Enter on LOT A tab 2016 Enter on LOT C tab 2016 2016 Enter on LOT F tab 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Enter on LOT A tabFord Wagon - Interior Conversion by TransitworksEnter on LOT C tab Starcraft Starcraft Enter on LOT F tab Starcraft Starcraft Starcraft Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Enter on LOT A tabHigh Roof Long WB with Transitworks Package EEnter on LOT C tab Allstar Allstar Enter on LOT F tab Allstar Allstar Allstar XL Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code Enter on LOT A tabX2X (Ford) with Transitworks Interior ConversionEnter on LOT C tab 2999 2999 Enter on LOT F tab 2910 2965 22916 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price Enter on LOT A tab $47,996.00 Enter on LOT C tab $52,855.00 $53,923.00 Enter on LOT F tab $59,773.00 $72,967.00 $88,700.00 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price Enter on LOT A tab $155,375.00 Enter on LOT C tab $208,440.00 $184,320.00 Enter on LOT F tab $1,472,225.00 $1,350,150.00 $468,717.00 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot No Bid $2,555,175.00 No Bid $3,379,740.00 $3,419,700.00 No Bid $10,438,175.00 $8,646,850.00 $3,129,717.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

EMPIRE BUS SALES, LLC

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
YES NO NO YES NO NO YES YES YES NO NO YES YES

Chassis Model Year 2016 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab 2016 Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab 2016 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT K tab 2016 2016

Chassis Make Dodge Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab FORD Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab FORD CHEVROLET FORD INTERNATIONAL Enter on LOT K tab INTERNATIONAL ELDORADO

Chassis Model GRAND CARAVAN Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab E350 Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab E450 G4500 F550 TC Enter on LOT K tab TC EZ-RIDER II

Chassis Model Code RTKM53 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab PC505 Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab 35

Body Model Year 2016 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab 2016 Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab 2016 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT K tab 2016 2016

Body Make ELDORADO Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab ELDORADO Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab ELDORADO ELDORADO ELDORADO ELDORADO Enter on LOT K tab ELDORADO ELDORADO

Body Model AMERIVAN Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab AEROTECH Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab AEROTECH AEROTECH AERO ELITE AERO ELITE Enter on LOT K tab PASSPORT EZ-RIDER II

Body Model Code PT Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab 200 Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab 240 240 290 320 Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab 35

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price $40,872.00 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab $55,255.00 Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab $61,440.00 $73,743.00 $81,600.00 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab $233,862.00 $336,581.00

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price $106,000.00 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab $296,340.00 Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab $2,171,755.00 $665,525.00 $595,051.00 Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab $477,295.00 $414,260.00

Grand Total For Lot $1,740,880.00 No Bid No Bid $3,611,640.00 No Bid No Bid $11,387,755.00 $8,039,825.00 $3,043,051.00 No Bid No Bid $5,154,535.00 $7,145,880.00

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

Fenton Mobility Products Inc. 

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
NO YES NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO

Chassis Model Year Enter on LOT A tab 2016 Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Enter on LOT A tab Ford Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Enter on LOT A tab Transit 350 Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT A tab X2X Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year Enter on LOT A tab 2016 Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Enter on LOT A tab Ford Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Enter on LOT A tab Transit 350 Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code Enter on LOT A tab X2X Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price Enter on LOT A tab $54,336.00 Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price Enter on LOT A tab $95,350.00 Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot No Bid $2,812,150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

Matthews Buses Inc.

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
YES NO NO YES YES NO YES YES YES YES YES NO NO

Chassis Model Year 2016 Enter on LOT B tab 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT F tab 2016 2016 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Dodge Enter on LOT B tab Ford Ford Ford Enter on LOT F tab Ford Chevrolet Ford Freightliner Custom ChassisFreightliner Custom Chassis Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Grand Caravan Enter on LOT B tab E-350 E-350 E-350 Enter on LOT F tab E-450 G4500 F-550 S2C S2C Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code AVP/SE Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab   Enter on LOT F tab      Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year 2016 Enter on LOT B tab 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT F tab 2016 2016 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Braun Enter on LOT B tab Goshen Coach Goshen Coach Goshen Coach Enter on LOT F tab Goshen Coach Goshen Coach Goshen Coach Goshen Coach Goshen Coach Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Entervan Enter on LOT B tab Pacer II Impulse Impulse Enter on LOT F tab Impulse Impulse G-Force Commander Commander Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code Commercial ADA Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Impulse 257 Impulse 263 Enter on LOT F tab Impulse 308 Impulse 314 G-Force 380 Commander 384 Commander 430 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price $38,595.00 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab $54,099.00 $55,342.00 Enter on LOT F tab $59,699.00 $71,132.00 $80,198.00 $109,857.00 $114,359.00 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price $47,000.00 Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab $175,425.00 $171,225.00 Enter on LOT F tab $1,243,175.00 $92,750.00 $405,475.00 $253,175.00 $531,150.00 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot $1,590,800.00 No Bid No Bid $3,421,365.00 $3,491,745.00 No Bid $10,198,025.00 $7,205,950.00 $2,811,415.00 $2,450,315.00 $7,392,690.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

New Flyer of America Inc. 

(30 Foot)

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO YES

Chassis Model Year Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab 2016

Chassis Make Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab New Flyer

Chassis Model Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MiDi

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MD30 (30 feet)

Body Model Year Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab 2016

Body Make Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab New Flyer

Body Model Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MiDi

Body Model Code Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MD30 (30 feet)

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab $317,819.24

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab $207,450.00

Grand Total For Lot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,563,834.80

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

New Flyer of America Inc. 

(35 Foot)

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO NO YES

Chassis Model Year Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab 2016

Chassis Make Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab New Flyer

Chassis Model Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MiDi

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MD35 (35 feet)

Body Model Year Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab 2016

Body Make Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab New Flyer

Body Model Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MiDi

Body Model Code Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MD35

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab $328,299.98

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab $207,450.00

Grand Total For Lot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,773,449.60

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages

Rohrer Bus

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
NO NO NO NO NO YES NO NO NO NO NO NO NO

Chassis Model Year Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab 2016 Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Ford Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab E450 Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tabChampion uses FP16S as designator for E4 chassisEnter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab 2016 Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Champion Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab LF Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab LF270FP Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab $114,943.00 Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab $753,710.00 Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,351,430.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

Shepard Bros., Inc.

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
YES NO YES YES YES NO YES NO NO NO NO NO NO

Chassis Model Year 2016 Enter on LOT B tab 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT F tab 2016 Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make MV-1 Enter on LOT B tab Ford Ford Ford Enter on LOT F tab Ford Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model DX Enter on LOT B tab E350 E350 E350 Enter on LOT F tab E450 Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code N/A Enter on LOT B tab E3F E3F E3F Enter on LOT F tab E4F Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year N/A Enter on LOT B tab 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT F tab 2016 Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make MV1 Enter on LOT B tab Coach & Equipment Coach & Equipment Coach & Equipment Enter on LOT F tab Coach and Equipment Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model N/A Enter on LOT B tab Phoenix SRW Metrolite Phoenix Phoenix Enter on LOT F tab Phoenix Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code N/A Enter on LOT B tab N/A N/A N/A Enter on LOT F tab N/A Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price $39,059.02 Enter on LOT B tab $47,200.00 $49,078.00 $50,749.00 Enter on LOT F tab $55,945.00 Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price $27,600.00 Enter on LOT B tab $92,920.00 $177,408.00 $187,140.00 Enter on LOT F tab $1,434,285.00 Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot $1,589,960.80 No Bid $1,980,920.00 $3,122,088.00 $3,232,080.00 No Bid $9,826,035.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit Price 

or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot shall 

deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-22945, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 07/29/2015)

W.N.Y. BUS PARTS, INC.

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT A LOT B LOT C LOT D LOT E LOT F LOT G LOT H LOT I LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description
Low Floor Vehicle 

<10,000 lb.

High Headroom Wagon 

<10,000 lb.

Single Rear Wheel 

Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway <22 ft.
Low Floor Cutaway

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft.

Dual Rear Wheel 

Cutaway >22 ft. 

(Alternate Fuels)

Medium Duty 

Cutaway 
Conventional Style Conventional Style

Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]
4 Passenger [3A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 7 Passenger [6A/1WC] 9 Passenger [8A/1WC]

11 Passenger 

[10A/1WC]

17 Passenger 

[15A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

16 Passenger 

[14A/2WC]

20 Passenger 

[18A/2WC]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
NO NO NO YES YES NO YES YES YES YES YES NO NO

Chassis Model Year Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab 2016 2016 Enter on LOT F tab 2016 2016 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab FORD FORD Enter on LOT F tab FORD GENERAL MOTORS FORD FORD FORD Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab E350 E350 Enter on LOT F tab E450 CHEVY C4500 F550 F650 F650 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab 2016 2016 Enter on LOT F tab 2016 2016 2016 2016 2016 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab GLAVAL GLAVAL Enter on LOT F tab GLAVAL GLAVAL GLAVAL GLAVAL GLAVAL Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab UNIVERSAL UNIVERSAL Enter on LOT F tab UNIVERSAL TITAN II ENTOURAGE CONCORDE II CONCORDE II Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab Enter on LOT D tab Enter on LOT E tab Enter on LOT F tab Enter on LOT G tab Enter on LOT H tab Enter on LOT I tab Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 40 50 40 60 60 40 150 100 30 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab $54,918.32 $56,193.03 Enter on LOT F tab $61,451.79 $68,801.19 $78,849.32 $110,200.21 $112,215.96 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price Enter on LOT A tab Enter on LOT B tab Enter on LOT C tab $283,942.05 $286,192.05 Enter on LOT F tab $2,054,962.20 $673,084.00 $560,761.16 $254,965.55 $732,546.60 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,579,041.25 $3,657,773.85 No Bid $11,272,730.70 $7,553,203.00 $2,926,240.76 $2,458,969.75 $7,465,504.20 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT A") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit 

Price or one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT A"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot 

shall deem the bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 
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