Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER 292
BID OPENING 6/12/2015
GROUP NUMBER 38700

PURCHASING OFFICER ] eflnifef KU:hn
TELEPHONE 5184739625

DESCRIPTION

Advanced Scientific Equipment




STATE OF NEW YORK

EXECUTIVE DEPARTMENT

OFFICE OF GENERAL SERVICES

MAYOR ERASTUS CORNING 2ND TOWER
THE GOV. NELSON A ROCKEFELLER
EMPIRE STATE PLAZA

ALBANY, NY 12242

-
This is to certify that |, / “e

have been duly authori to open bids for materials, equipment
and supplies, and that competitive bids on Group No. 38700

were received and opened at the Office Of General Services,
Procurement Services Group, Albany, NY in accordance with

IFB NO. 22962

on Friday, June 12, 2015 at 11:00 AM

and that all bids received before the time of bid opening appear
on the attached tabulation of bids.

Date: June 12, 2015

Signature

BID ROOM FACILITATOR



NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. G ene ral SerVices Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | http //nyspro.ogs ny.gov | customer.service@ogs ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6,22.4,
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.qgov MWBE Designated
_Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify yolir express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B {General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139- and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affims that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j(3) and §139-J(8)(b). Information may be accassed at;

Procuremeant Lobbying: i
Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identlfication Number:;
(Do Not Use Social Sacurity Number) (See New York State Vendor File Registration
Clause)
27-1082047 271082047
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: .
AB Sciex LLC
D/B/A — Doing Business As (if applicable):
SCIEX
Street City State County Zip Code
1201 Radio Rd Redwood City CA San Mateo 94065
If applicable, place an "x" in the a propriate NY o,
bonos) — SIS CINYS Minority CINYS Women
{check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If appiicabls, place an “x" in the appropriala DPania"y
box{es) CIManufactured [ASolely Manufactured
(check all that apply) . Manufactured .
Within NYS Outside NYS OutSIdne NYS
i _ 7 {outside)
Bidder's Signature; Printed or Typed Name: Freda Brinkiey
ite: Director, Sales Administration Date:
Jone 9, 20/5
If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
[CJWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID O
RNOBID & o (i ves

SN




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

oFPoRTUNITY. | (S aral Services Services

Coming Tower, Emplre State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | cuslomer service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to § years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.gov MWBE Designated
Contacts

The Bld must be fully and proparly executed by an authorized parson. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and fult knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A {(Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B (Ganeral Spacifications), and State Finance Law
§139-] and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying}, and that all Information provided is complete, true, and accurats. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agraes to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
requirad by State Finance Law §139-J(3) and §139-){6){b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: hitp:/ .00s.ny.qov/about lations/defaullSFL _139i-k.as
Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor ldentification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Securily Number) {See New York State Vendor Fila Registration
Clause,
62-1369733 1100009992 d

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Advanced Measurement Technology, Inc,

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code
801 S. llinois Avenue Oak Ridge TN Anderson 37831
If applicable, place an *x” in the appropriate NYS Small g
bax(es) Bctllsiness CINYS Minority CINYS women
(check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an "X In the appropriale XSolely L IPartially
box(es) CManufactured Manufactured
(chack all that appiy) Within NYS it P Outside NYS

L uiside % (outside)
Bidder's Sjgnature: Printed or Typed Name:

Kelley Armstrong
Title: Date:
Division VP of Operations b l niis

i you are not bidding, place an *x” in the box and return this page only.
CIWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID
2 -Cps

ML
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NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPFORTUNITY., General Services SEl’ViCES

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp.finyspro.egs ny gov | customer service@ogs ny.gov | 518-474.6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER; SPECIFICATICN REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4,
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.gov MWBE Designated
Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an autherized parson. By signing, you certify your exprass authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B (General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139.) and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying}, and that all information pravided Is complets, true, and accurate, By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS proceduras relative 1o permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j(3) and §139-j(6)(b). Information may be accessed at:

Procuremeni Lobbying: njjg‘llwww.ggg.ny.ggvlggg!!gggglrgg!!IgﬁgnglggfggllgFL 139j-k asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Numbaer:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See New York State Vendor File Registration
Clause)
77-0518772 1000041204

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Agilent Technologies, Inc.

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code
2850 Centerville Road Wilmington DE New Castle [19808
if applicable, place an “x” In the appropriate L
box(es) 4 s BDu s':'r:ressss mall CINYS Minority [INYS Women
{check all that apply} # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an *x"in the appropriate . I:IPartialIy
box(es) OManufactured ESolely Manufactured

: . ) QOutside NYS % (outside)
Bidder's Signature; ﬁ%’/ Printed or Typed Name:

W

Tile: Contracts Specialist Date: June 4, 2015

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and return this page only.
CIWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID

2 -CD’s
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NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

DPPORTUNITY. General Services Services

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | httpz/inyspro.ogs ny.gov | customer service@ogs.ny.gov | 51 8-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile Ses Section 6.22.4,
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.qov MWBE Designated
Contacis

The Bld must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or ather entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracis), Appendix B (General Specifications), and State Finance Law

§"| and § ocureme pDLOVIRG}, afd dl o . proviged DIEELS, 2 d g ae. o ¥ 134
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures ralative to permissible contacts as
srequired by State Finance Law §1394(3) and §139-(6)(b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: http:/; .00S wviaboutCasirequlations/default SFL 139k
Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See New York State Vendar Fife Registration
_ : Clause)
$5-1040600 1000032886

Legal Business Name of Company Bldding:
Beckman Coulter, Inc.

D/BIA - Doing Business As (if applicable):
Not Applicable

Strest City State County Zip Code
250 South, Kraemer Blvd Brea 92821
Mail Station E2-SE-08 cA Orange
If applicable, ptace an "X in the appropriate I NYS Smalt .
box(es) Business [CINYS Minority CNYsS Women
(check all that apply) # Emplovees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an X' in the appropriate [CPartially
box(es) CIManufactured Eai?:fealglurad Manufactured
{check all fh?fp’y) Within NYS Outslde NYS Outside NYS
p % {outside)
Printed or Typed Name:
Connie Chiem
Date: June 8, 2015

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and retumn this page only.
[_JWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID '
.2. - CD 5
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NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

OPPORTUNITY. General Sewices Services

Comning Tower, Empire Stale Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp-/inyspro.0gs.ny.gov | customer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AM ET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4. MWBE
Jennifer. Kuhn@ogs.ny.gov Designated Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B {General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139-] and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all information providad is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-}(3) and §139-j(6)({b). Information may be accessed at:

Pracurement Lobbying: hitp://www.ogs.ny.qoviabout requlations/defaultSFL_139j-k.as

Bidder's Federal Tax Icientlﬁcation Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See New York State Vendor File Registration
Clause)
33-1064877 1000017635

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

Bruker Daltonics INC
D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code
40 Manning Road Billerica MA Middlesex 01821
If applicable, place an *x” in the appropriate L] NYS Small S
box(es) Business CINYS Minority CINYS Women
(check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate = I:IPartiaIIy
box(es) Manufactured BdSolely M
{check alf that apply) \Pﬁth; NYS ure Manufactured Qutside Ozg?éicﬁ'{,esd
/ A NYS e NS
P o {outside)
Bidder's Signature: B Printed or Typed Name:
Victor Fursey
Title: Vice President Sales North Amgfica Date: 05/18/2015

If you are not bidding, place an “x” infthe box ant return this page only.
WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

: RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID '
i, 2 D



NEW YORK

STATE OF
OPPORTUHNITY.

Officeof UL
General Services | >€rvices

Procurement

Coming Tower, Empire Stale Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp.#/nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-5717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AM ET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22862 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to & years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.gov MWBE Designated
Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yoursslf, your company, or ather entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A {Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts}, Appendix B (General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139-] and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying}, and that all information provided is complets, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j(3) and §139-J(6)(b). Information may be accessed at;

Procurement Lobbying: hitp-fiwww ogs.ny gov/aboulOgs/requiations/defaultSFL 139j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Soclal Security Number) {See New York State Vendor File Registration
4E1mq2 e
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
BIB/A — Doing Business ‘As (if applicable);
Street City State County Zip Code
19 ’Fb(bl\unc Drwee, Billerica MA [Middbex  [OsY
applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate N _
box(es) P PRIOP El si:essssma“ CINYS Minority CINYS Women
(chack all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “” in the appropriate OPartially
box(es) bdSolely
tor ot e R
Y , Outside NYS % (outside)
Bidder's Signatur% Printed or Typed Name:
Fred Hords
Title: Date:
{ iR l.! 10. |5

if youare not bidding, place ar’ “x" In the boX and return this page only.
[CJWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID
2 FLDeve -

oo
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NEW YORK | Office of Procurement

STATE GOF

OPPORTUNITY General Services SEI‘ViceS

Corning Tower. Empire Stale Plaza, Albany NY 12242 | hitp /inyspro ogs ny gov | cuslomer service@ogs ny gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

[ BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AM ET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
o r 3 DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.qov MWBE Designated
Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an autherized person. By signing, you cerlify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B (Ganeral Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139-) and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j(3) and §139-j{6)(b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: hitp:/iwww.ogs ny.gov/aboulQgsirequlations/defaultSFL 139j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Secunty Number) {5ee New York State Vendor File Registration
Clause)
04-2170233 04-2170233

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding

| EMD Millipore Corporation
D/BIA — Doing Business As (if applicable):

same
Street City State County Zip Code
290 Concord Road Billerica MA Middlesex 01821
If applicable, pl “*" in th riat N
! ;‘l:zgsc)zb e, place an “x” in the appropriale Els':lnvess sSmall CINYS Mlnpnly ONYS Worpen
(check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate [Isolel ClPartially
box{es) COManufactured M fe gt d Manufactured
{check all that apply) Within NYS anuiacture Outside NYS
Outside NYS %

o (ouiside)
Bidder's Signature: Q—_ Printed or Typed Name: Warren Stone
Title: Head of Sales North America, Lab Americas Date: & \E \2@\:

If you are not bidding, ptace an "x” in the box and return this page only.
[JWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID ,
| FlaskDe.

ST~



CHE
T NEWYORK | (3fFice of Procurement

STATE OF

\“;I;:‘m INITY General S@Wices Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp #inyspro.ogs.ny gov | customer service@ogs ny gav | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADBRESS ONLY
{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: . - TITLE: Group 368700 :
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewrde)
TIME: 11:00 AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4 MWBE
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.gov Designated Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or ather entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B (General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139+} and §139-k (Procurement Lobbylng), and that all Information provided Is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j(3) and §138-j{6)(b}. Information may be accessed at;

Procurement Lobbying: http:/fwww.ogs.ny.gov/aboutOgs/requlations/defaultt SEL 13%j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax ldentification Numbesr: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Sscurity Number) (See New York State Vendor File Registration
77-0249862 . Clause)
. 1000033576

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

Entech Instruments, Inc.
D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City . State County Zip Cade

Simi Valtey CA Ventura 93065
2207 Agate Court g
If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate I NYS Small -
S Business %lNYg g‘lmgnty [ONYS Women
(check all that appiy) # Employees wned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an X" in the appropriale OIsolely (Partially
box{(es) OManufactured . Manufactured
(check ailthet apoly) Within NYS Nonufactured Quiside | o tside NYS

% (outside)
Bidder's Signature: Printed or Typed Name: Susan Moore
W Date: , /
Title: - G/ﬂ / 2
L}

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM 2 - FLOr.

M




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement
OPPORTUNITY. General Sel'Vices Services

Carning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp:/inyspro.cgs.ny.gov | customer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 51B-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING:
DATE: 6/12/2015
TIME: 11:00 AMET

TITLE: Group 38700
Advanced Scientific EQuipment & Instruments {Statewide)
Classification Codes: 41 and 42

SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:;

22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4
Jennifer. Kuhn@ogs.ny.gov MWRBE Designated
Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly exacuted by an authorized parson. By signing, you certify your express authority to
slgn on behalf of yourse!f, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix 8 (General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139 and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided Is complete, true, and accurate, By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j(3) and §139-J(6)(b). Information may be accessed at:

Procuremant Lobbying: hitp:llwww.ggs.ny.govlaboutOgslregulgt!onsldefaurtSFL 139i-k.asp

Bidder's Fedaral Tax Identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number)

NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(See New York State Vendor File Registration

Cl

42 0704420 1000031751 -
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Hach Company

 D/BIA — Doing Business As (i applicable);
N/A
Street City Slate County Zip Code
5600 Lindbergh Drive Loveland Colorado Lanimer 80538
If applicable, place an X" in the a riate .
bonges) " G EJS'}‘LSSSS“" CINYS Minority CINYS Women
(check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If appilcable, place an “x" in the appropriate S [Partially
bC;:((Bz) o CIManufactured izlfe;gture - Manufactured
{check all that apply) Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS

% (outside)

Printed or Typed Nama: Gary Dreher
Date: June 12, 2015

Bidder's Sign : 7 7 7
Title: Vice Presidé

If you are nol bidding, place an “%" in the box and return this page only.
[JWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID

H-QD's
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NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. Ge nera[ SerVi ces Services

L
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)
BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AM ET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4. MWRBE
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.n!.gov Designated Cantacts

The Bid must be fully and proparly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on bahalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracis), Appendix B (General Spacifications), and State Finance Law
§139-j and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,
Biddar affirms that it understands and agreas to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j(3) and §1394{6)({b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: httg:!lmw.ogs.nz.goviaboulggslrsgu.alions!derault§FL 139i-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor [dentification Number-
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See New York State Vendor Fila Regisiration
22-2701363 L)

Legal Busingss Name of Company Bidding:
LEICA MICROSYSTEMS, INC.

D/B/A — Doing Business As (if applicable):

N/A
Street City State County Zip Code
1700 LEIDER LANE BUFFALO GROVE L LAKE 60089
I applicable, pface an “x” in the appropriate .
box{es) P PRMp Eg:essssma" CINYS Minority [ONYS Women
(chack all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriale [CiPartially
box(es) OManufactured DiSotely ] Manufactured
(check all that apply) | Within NYS Manufactured Cutside Outside NYS
_ : % (autside)
Bidder's Signature: { Printed or Typed Name:
j - \_\_’_ Peater Reimer
Title: vice Prasident- LMS Americas Date: o6 09.2015
If you are not bidding, place an ¥ in the box and return this page only.
CIWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:
RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO EID
2 ~-CO'%
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NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. G e neral Servi ces Services

Cormning Tower, Empirs State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Sclentific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD; Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4,
Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.n!.gt:-v MWBE Designated
Contacts

The Bld must be fully and properly executed by an authorized parson. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendlix A {Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B {General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139 and §139-k {Procuremant Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true, and accurate, By signing,
Bldder affirms that it understands and agress to comply with the OGS procedures ratative 1o permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-{(3) and §1394(6)(b). Information may be accessed at;

Procurement Labbying: hgp:[lwww.ms.ny_.gav!abgutOgslregulaﬁonsldefgultSFL 139j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See New York State Vendor File Registration
. - Clause)
55 -03130%% {00000 Y07 &

Legal Businass Name of Company Bidding:

LiIFE TECHNIOLOG IES CORPORATIONAs
D/BIA ~ Doing Business As (if applicable):

/
Street City State County Zip Cade
SY¥U VAN BLLER 1BY CARLSBAD (o2 SAN DIEGO | G000
If licable, pl “x" in th ial
boxtas) 1 F s an X' In the appropriate Els';'fﬁss’“a" CINYS Minority CINYS Women
{check all that apply) # Employses Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate parﬁauy
box(es) BManufactyred [ISlely Manufactured
{check all that apply) - Manufactured ”
Within NYS Outside NYS Outsrdf NYS

: i % (outside)

Bidder's Signature: Printed or Typed Name:
é M ( ( 4 | GEMOFFIR, MACLEOD

Title: N Date:
VICE PRESIDENT ¢ GENERAL COUNISEL June &, 0I5~

If you are not bidding, place an “x in the box and retumn this page only.
[JWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS FART OF BID OR NO BID

lbCD's

{8~




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY G ene ral Sewices Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | http./fnyspro.ogs.ny.gov | cusiomer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6M12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOQD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4
Jennifer. Kuhn@ogs.nv.goy MWBE Designated
Contacts _

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authorityto
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of thisSOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B {(General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139-] and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, trus, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to parmissible contacts as
raquired by State Finance Law §139-J(3) and §139-j(6)(b). Infarmation may be accessedat:

Procurement Lobbying: htip:/feww.ogs.ny. goviaboul ulations/defaultSFL 13%-k as
Bidder's Federal Tax ldentification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Usa Social Security Number) {See New York Slate Vendor File Registration
Clause)
26-1187239 1100126227

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

Markes International, Inc.
D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code

11126 Kenwood Road, Suite D Cincinnati OH Hamillon 45242

If applicable, place an “X" in the appropriate I NYS Small L

box(es) Business CINYS Minarity CINYS Women

{check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business

If applicable, place an *x” in the appropriate X Solel UPartially

box(es) CIManufactured M of: c¥ d Manufactured

check ail that apply) Within NYS anuracuire Outside NYS
Outside NYS % (outside)

Bidder's Signature: Printed or Typed Name:

Title: Vice Dr. Peter Grosshans

President and ' Date: 6/9/2015

General Manager

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and retumn this pageonly.
[JWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID
2 - (. Verives

A



NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY General Services SEI"ViCES

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp:#fnyspro.ogs.ny. gov | customer service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptabhle)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments {Statewide)
TIME: 11.00 AM ET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER; SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Seclion £.22.4
dJennifer. Kuhn@ogs.ny.gov MWBE Designated
Contacts

The Bld must be fully and properly exacuted by an authorized person. By signing, you cerilfy your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B {General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§129-f and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all Information provided is compiete, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139:)(3) and §139-j(6)({b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: hitofiwww.ogs.ny.qov/ { requiations/defaultSFL_139j-k.a

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number; NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Numben) (See New York State Vendor File Regisiration
Clause
04-3361624 1000005284 )

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
PerkinElmer Health Sciences, Inc.

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable}.

Street ) City State County Zip Code
710 Bridgeport Ave. Shelton cT Fairfield 06484
ga;(»pli)cable. place an °x” in the appropriale L] NYS Small CINYS Minority CINYS Women
ox{es i

{check aif that apply) Busune;sEm plovees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriale DPartiaIly
box(es) OManufactured ESolely Manufactured
{check alf that apply) Within NYS gﬁg?ézc'&l;gd Outside NYS

% (outside)

Bidder's Signature: Printed or Typed Nama:
Judith Albrecht

Date:  06,02.15
If you are piot bigiding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
Cwe Ayé ABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID

2 Floi LD

—{(p___

Title: Assigtant/Secretary




NEW YORK

STATE OF
OPPORTUNITY.

Office of

Procurement
General Services | Services

Corming Tower, Empire Stale Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp.#inyspro ogs.ny.gov | cuslomer serv ce@ogs ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE

ADDRESS ONLY

(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING:
DATE: 6/12/2015
TIME: 11:00 AM ET

TITLE: Group 38700
Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
Classification Codes: 41 and 42

Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.qov

SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 _ As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4

MWBE Designated

Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an authcrized parson. By signing,

slgn on behalf of yourself, your company, or ather entity and full knowled
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts),
§139-] and §139-k (Procurement Lobbylng),

you certify your express authority to

ge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix B (General Specifications), and State Finance Law
and that all Informatlon provided Is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,

Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the 0GS procedures relative to permissible contacts as

required by State Finance Law §139-J(3)

and §139-J(6)(b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: http:/fwww.ogs.ny.qov/aboutOgsirequlations/default SFL 139j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number:
{Do Net Use Social Security Number)

521035956

NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{See New York State Vendor File Registration
Clause)}

1000009421
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
|__Shimadzu Scientific Instruments, Inc.
D/B/A ~ Doing Business As (if applicable):
Street City State County Zip Code
7102 Riverwoed Drive Columbia MD USA 21046
ga?plh):able. place an “¥" in the appropriate ] NYS Small CINYS Minority CINYS Women
ox{es il
(check all that apply) EUS'"e;SEmployee . Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate EIPartiaIIy
bﬂ;(e;) i OManufactured N%iﬂlfalzture d Manufactured
eheck all that apply) Within NYS Outsice NYS Outside NYS
% (outside)

Bidder's Signature:

/%/4/

Printed or Typed Name:
Sean T. Randall

Title: Date:

Regional Manager June 11, 2015
If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.

CJWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID

2, . PI:DC\JI.‘:
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NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. G ene ral SerVices Services

Coming Tower, Empire Stale Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | htip //nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-5717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22862 As Incorporated.in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
: DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4 MWBE
Jennifer. Kuhn@ogs.ny.qov Designated Contacts

Tha Bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B {General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§129-] and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all infermaticn provided is complete, trus, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j{3) and §139-j{6)(b). Information may be accessed at;

Procurement Lobbying: hitp://www.ogs. ny.qov/. reguiations/default SFL139j-k.
Bidder's Federal Tax [dentification Number: NYS Vendor [dentification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See New York State Vendor File Registration
s Clause)
57-0539 707 L0000 /808

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

T H Twstruments - Wategs LC

D/B/A -~ Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Cade
ews De_ New Castie | DE  (Mew Custle| 19 720
Lf;;(vzlsl)cable. place an “x" in the appropriate EIS':I:;SS sSmall CINYS Minority CINYS Women
{chack all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “x' in the appropriate [lsolely LlPartially
box(es) COOManufactured . Manufactured
(check all that apply) Within NYS Manufactured Outside | ouiside NYS
| \ P % (outside)
Bidders Signature: % Printed or Typed Name:
[ Wakeew PocK

Title: Warren Bock, Vice President Date: N\~

TA Instrument§~Waters LLC lo / of ‘ 1o

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID

| Fﬂbrnde



NEW YORK

STATE OF
OPFORTUNITY

Officeof ALl
General Services | >¢€rvices

Procurement

Corning Tower, Empire Staie Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | http:/inyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

The Bid must be fully and property executed by an authorized person. By signing,
sign on hehalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and a
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts},
§139-j and §138-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AM ET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4, MWBE
Jennifer. Kuhn@ogs.ny.gov Designated Contacts

you certify your express authority ta
cceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix B (General Specifications), and State Finance Law

Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relativa to permissible contacts as
raquired by Stata Finance Law §139-j(3) and §1 39-j(6){b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Laobbying: hﬂg:ﬂwww.ggs.n!.gov!gmutggslrﬂulg]éong{defggllSFL 139j-k.asp

01-0222106

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Securily Numbar)

NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(See New York State Vendor Fils Registration
Clause}

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
The Baker Company, Inc

D/B/A — Doing Business As (if applicable);

161 Gatehouse Road

1 l%ity: Sanford State ME | County ;YORK | 04073
applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate NYS Small .
box{es) Business CInys Minority INYS Women
(check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate LPartially
box(es) Xsolely
{check all that apply) VI:VIichci?:'n;f?gwred Manufactured Quiside gsg?;aecﬂ"\ﬁesd
i i . - P W A _ % (outside)
Bidder’s Signature VUL ] Printed or Typed Name:
~J MaryAnne Martin
Title: Contract Admiunistrator Date: 6/11/2015
If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and retum this page only.
WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:
RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID | FQ2anl 0 -
-~ W

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM

L _

INDIVIDUAL, CORPORATION, PAR
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NEW YORK

STATE OF
OPPORTUNITY.

Officeof e
General Services | ~ervices

Procurement

Caming Tower, Empire Stale Plaza, Albany. NY 12242 | hitp./#nyspro ogs ny gov | customer. service@ags.ny gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING:
DATE: 6/12/2015
TIME: 11:00 AM ET

TITLE: Group 38700

Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
Classification Codes: 41 and 42

Jennifer.Kuhn@ogs.ny.qov

SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 vears with 2 possible 1-year renawals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Narmile See Section 6.22 4 MWBE

Designated Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B (General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139- and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all Information provided Is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-j(3) and §139-j(6){b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: htip./ww ogs.ny gov/aboutOgs/requlations/default SFL 139i-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number;
- (Do Not Use Social Securily Number)

NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{See New York State Vendor File Registration

Clause)
43-1992201 1000009361
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Thermo Electron North America LLC
D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):
Street City State FL County Zip Code
1400 Northpoint Parkway, Ste 10 West Palm Beach West Palm 33407
Ta;:plicable. place an X" in the appropriate LI NYS Small CINYS Minority CINYS Women
ox{es) Business : .

{check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate = I:IPartially
box(es) OManufactured izgzture d Outsige | Manufactured
(check ail that apply) Within NYS NYS Outside NYS

% (oulside)

Bidder's Signature:

Title: Contracts Manager

Thomas Norman

Date: 52212015

Printed or Typed Name:

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID

2-Cb=*

o



NEWYORK | Office of Procurement
OPPORTUNITY. General SerVices Services

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp:#/inyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
(E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING:
DATE: 6/12/2015
TIME: 11:00 AM ET

TITLE: Group 38700
Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
Classification Codes: 41 and 42

SOLICITATION NUMBER:

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:

22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS: _
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4

Jennifer. Kuhn@ogs.ny.qov MWBE Designated

Contacts

The Bid must be fully and properly exscuted by an authorized person. By signing, you cartify your expsess authority to
sign on behalf of yoursalf, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptanca of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Contracts), Appendix B (General Spaecifications), and State Finance Law
§139 and §139-k (Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complets, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that It understands and agress to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as
required by State Finance Law §139-J(3) and §139-}{6){b). Information may be accessed at:

Procurement Lobbying: hitp:/iwww, .qov/ i i faul 139§-k.

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identificaion Number:
(See New York State Vendor File Regisiration

(Do Not Use Social Security Number)
Clause)

04-3234558 1000005279

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

_\ALaLensleghmlpg‘.es Corporation
D/B/A — Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code
34 Maple Street Milford MA Worcester 01757
If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate ] NYS Small .
box{es) Business CINYS Minority (INYS Women
{check all that apply) # Employees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, ptace an “x” in the appropriate kJSolet Dﬁgﬂially
box(es) OManufactured y Manufactured
{check all that apply) Within NYS Maanactured Outside NYS

Outside NYS % (oulside)
Bidder's SQW//? & Printed or Typed Name:

%_—
Mark N. Groudas

Tile: Vice President, Americas Field Operations | pate: 4 - e

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
CIWE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO BID .
QD

8



NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. Ge neral Serv'ces Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 [ hitp:/inyspro.ogs.ny gov | customer service@ops.ny gov | 518-474-6717

Solicitation

BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE

ADDRESS CONLY

{E-Mail or Facsimile Bids are NOT Acceptable)

BID OPENING: TITLE: Group 38700
DATE: 6/12/2015 Advanced Scientific Equipment & Instruments (Statewide)
TIME: 11:00 AMET Classification Codes: 41 and 42
SOLICITATION NUMBER: SPECIFICATION REFERENCE:
22962 As Incorporated in the Solicitation
CONTRACT PERIOD: Up to 5 years with 2 possible 1-year renewals
DESIGNATED CONTACTS:
PRIMARY CONTACT SECONDARY CONTACT MWBE CONTACTS
Jennifer Kuhn John Normile See Section 6.22.4,
Jennifer n .NY.OV MWBE Designated
Contacts |

The Bid must ba fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to
sign on behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity and full knowledge and acceptance of this SOLICITATION,
Appendix A (Standard Clauses for New York State Conitracts), Appendix B {General Specifications), and State Finance Law
§139+j and §139-k {Procurement Lobbying), and that all information provided is complete, true, and accurate. By signing,
Bidder affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures rolative to permissible contacts as

required by State Finance Law §139-j{3) and §139-j{6){b}. Inforrnallon may be accessed ai

Procurement Lobtbrying: Lo e, o

Bidder's Federal Tax identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number)

NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{See New Yorik State Vendor File Registration

Clause)

94-2266817 1000009789
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

PASCO scientific
D/B/A — Doing Business As (if applicable}):

PASCO scientific
Street Cily State County Zip Code

10101 Foothills Blvd Roseville CA Placer 95747
It applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate L] NYS Small CONYS Minority CINYS Women
box(es) Busi : q
{check all that apply) usmeistsgmployees Owned Business Owned Business
If applicable, place an "x" in the appropriate L 1Partially
box{es) CIManufactured %asn?llggture d Manufactured
{check &l thet apply) Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS

% (outside)

Bidder's Signature:

TR

& Contract Specialist |l

Printed or Typed Name
Greg Montgomery
Date:

6/10/15

WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box and return this page only.

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF

BiD OR NO BID )
2Crs-

N —
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