Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER 23008
BID OPENING 9/13/2016
GROUP NUMBER 05900

PURCHASING OFFICER  James Patrick

TELEPHONE (518) 408-1026

DESCRIPTION
Natural Gas
(Statewide)




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY, G erﬂeﬁ'aﬂ SQWEC@S Services

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp:finyspro.cgs.ny.gov | customer.sarvice@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS'" CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 518-486-5628.

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS

DATE: September 13, 2016 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM {INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 23008 Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Blds

CONTRACT PERIOD: 32-34 months based on start date with one two year renewal option. (August 2019)

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: {see section 1.6)
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on
behalf of yourself, your company, or other antity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Spacifications), and State Finance Law §139- and
§139-k {Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided Is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State
Finance Law §139- (3) and §139-f (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:

hitp:/lwww.ogs.ny.qov/aboutOgsiregulations/default SFL_139]-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number; NYS Vendor Identification Number;
{Do Not Use Saocial Securify Number) {See “New York Stale Vendor File Registration” clause)

//-3730428 /109/3%i"98
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: 5 3 PG L(,C,
DV Doing Business ha (f Spoioabla /ol LEA —,,‘ EASTE L~ bt ERC &

State County ‘ Zip Code

St%'?ff/‘/é'épf\/\/&w AA ‘3"?:9 Bﬁvo[ly,-/ MYy Gl /1237

If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate /f [ NYS Small Business o { NYS Minority Owned | NYS Women Owned
box{es) (check alf that apply): # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x”" in the appropriate [ Manufactured [  Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box{es) (check all that apply): Within NYS Qutside NYS Outside NYS o,

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and retum this page only.
O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signature: Q 87, AAs~ri~ Printed or Typed Name: (NLLA~T 32L_ivt € 77
Title:/MArAG 16 M EMEN pate: 7 /11 /6
Phone: 7| 2 4¥e-p9oo Extensian 3'W Toll Free Phohe: £2£ - §1 /- /IT Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax:?lﬁ (e 1 In Extension
E-mail Address: /A¢4RA3 @ 6%1’&9&2’& ot Gt c;. eMEompany Website: .
FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
[P.R.# 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O  OTHER O MISSING PAGES o

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID

S

~




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

OPPORTUNITY. General Services serViCES

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp:/inyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS" CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 518-486-5628.

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 — NATURAL GAS

DATE: September 13, 2016 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY — INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 23008 Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 32-34 months based on start date with one two year renewa! option. {August 2019)

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT.
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized parson. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on
behalf of yourself, your company, or ather entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
{Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS Genaral Specifications), and State Finance Law §1 394 and
§138-k (Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State
Finance Law §139- (3) and §139-] (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:

hitp:/iwww.ogs.ny.goviaboutOgsiregulations/default SFL._139{-k.asp

Bldder's Federal Tax ldentification Number: NYS Vendor [dentification Number;
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
SIARA0951C lovooYtoes

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding;
dlonial Enerqd Tpe.
D/B{A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code

2978 Fair Ri dj( or. Fei rPe ¥ VA Fairfa s 0?20323

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate [ NYS SmallBusiness [  NYS Minority Owned 7 NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check alf that apply). # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x” inthe appropriate 0O Manufactured [  Solely Manufactured 0 Partially Manufactured
box{es) (check all that apply). Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and return this page only.
0O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signature: M Printed or Typed Name: Og_u,' & Ama+
Tile:.  Sr. Risn Aaalyst pate: -8/
Phone: Extension Toll Free Phone: Extension
703.218-304Y% Extension Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: dafd + @ colapinlen g% )i cwm_Company Website:

' FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE CNLY
[ P.R.# 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID

S

—




—
f NEwWYORK | Office of _ grocyrement
\E:URTUNITY G eneral Servlces ervices

Coming Tower, Emplire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | htip:/inyspro ogs ny gov | customer servica@ogs ny gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 513-486-5628,

BID OPENING ITLE: Group 05900 — NATURAL GAS

DATE: September 13, 2016 {FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - INDEXED PRICE)
(IFB Number 23008 Classification Code: 15 Utllities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 32-34 months based on start date with ane twa year renewal option. (August 2019)
DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)

PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to aign on
behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
{Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139 and
§139-k (Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided Is complete, true and accurats. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees {0 comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State
Finance Law §139-) (3) and §139- (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at;

h X111 10gs/reg

lations/defaultSFL._139]-k.asp
Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor |dentification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) (Sea “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
80-0909818

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Direct Energy Business Marketing, LLC

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

L

Streat City State County Zip Code

194 Wood Avenue South Iselin New Jersey Middlesex 08830
If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate [ NYS Small Business [0  NYS Minority Owned [J NYS Women Owned
box(es) {check all that apply). # Employees Business Business

if applicable, place an “x* in the appropriate [J Manufactured [ Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
x{as) (check all that apply): Within NYS Outsida NYS Outside NYS o

retumn this page only.
CAUSE:

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box-ap
O  WEARE UNABLE TO B|D AT Fd A

N1/
[pidcers Signature: 77 LA T

Title. Mark Taddeo, VP Direkf Salg's

Printed or Typed Name: mark Taddeo, VP Direct Sales
Date: September 12, 2016

Phone. . c16.a251 \_/  Extension Toll Free Phone: Extens!on
Extension Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Addrass; Victoria Dyckman@direclenergy.com Company Website
FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
| P.R. # 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O OTHER DO MISSING PAGES ]

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID




new vork | Office of procurement

STATE OF . -
DPPORTUNITY. General Sewlces Services

Corning Tower, Empire Stale Plaza, Albany, NY 122421 hitp Hinyspro ogs ny.gov { customer service@ogs ny gov | 51 8.474-6717

Invitation For Bids
IMPORTANT: SEE »NOTICE T0 BlDDERS" CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

Faxed and E-mail Bid submissions are pot accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 51 8-486-5628.

0 L GAS
(FIRM SUPPLY — FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
(INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - NDEXED PRICE)

Code: 15 Utilities
ns Incorporated in the invitation For Bids

year renewal option- {August 2019)

on 1.6)
SECONDARY CONT.
Bryant Kirk

d on start date with one two

DESIGNATED CONTACTS!: (see secti

The bid must e fully and properly 1 authorized person. By signing, you cartify your express authority to sign on
pehalf of yourself, your company, of other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS Ganeral Speclﬂcations), and State Finance Law §139 and
§139-k (Procuremant Lobbying Law), and that all information provldad is complets, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures ralative to permlssib!e contacts as required by State
Finance Law §1394(3) and §139- (8) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:
httg:llwww.ogs.ny.govlaboutOgslregulatlonsldefauitSFL 439j-k.asp

NYS Vendor 1dentification Number:
(See ‘New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)

1060023620

Bidder's Federal Tax identification Number:

(Do Not Use Social Securily Number)

Legal Business Name of Company gidding: 7~

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable).

Street 3 y 0 ,_C N 14'\/ City ng'VlX State N \l County an}( Zip Code l 0454_

\f applicable, place an “x* in th appropriate o NYS Small Business o NYS Minority Owned 0O NYS Women Owned
hox(es) {chack ail that apply}. # Employees Business Business

\f applicable, place an *x" in the appropriate m] Manufactured O Solely Manufactured 3 Partially Manufactured
moxles) (check all that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the boXx and return this page only.
o WE ARE UNABLE Vlo AT THISJIME BECAUSE:

Siaders Signature: / Brinted of Typed Name: Tinnt Patenidn

we: ( lnje £ Deming P pate: 9/ (10
Phone: 11t -4oL-S107 Extension N[F7 - Toll Free Phohe: !'%’-!L{«EC'ENE%Y Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax. Extension

Ay eL 0 Y cw\d aSe Lo Company Website: (Nubh gepoulranddes i
FOR NEW YOR ENT USE ONL (




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. General serVices Services

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza Albany, NY 12242 | htip:finyspro.ogs.ny gov | customer service@ogs. ny.gov [ 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepled with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 51 8-486-5628.

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS

DATE: September 13, 2018 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 23008 Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 32-34 months based on start date with one two year renewal option. {August 201 9)
DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)
'PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT;
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person, By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on
behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and
§139-k (Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State
Finance Law §139- (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:

httg:llwww.ogs.ng.guvlaboutOgsireguIationsldefauItSFL 138j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax ldentification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Secunity Number) {Ses "New York Stata Vendor Fils Registration” clause)
16-1352123 1000047921

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: Empire Natural Gas Corporation

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street ! City State County Zip Code
173 Airport Road Greene NY Chenango P 13778

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate & NYS Small Business O  NYS Minority Owned 0 NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply): /- # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate O Manufactured 0O  Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check all that apply). Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and return this page only.
O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signature. % M-,// Printed or Typed Name: Seth R. Barrows

Title: President Date: 9/12/16
Phone: (607) 656-7851 Extension Toll Free Phone: 888-659-8967 Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax; (607) 656-7854 Extension
E-mail Address: seth@empiranatgas.com Company Website: empirenatgas.com
FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
| P.R. # 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES ]

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID

2




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. General Services Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp://inyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 518-486-5628.

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS

DATE: September 13, 2016 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 23008 Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD; 32-34 months based on start date with one two year renewal option. (August 2019)

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)

PRIMARY CONTACT.: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on
behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
{Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139 and
§139-k (Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State
Finance Law §139-j (3) and §139- {6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:
http://iwww.ogs.ny.qoviaboutOgsirequlations/defaultSEL_139]-k.as

Bidder's Federal Tax ldentification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See “New York Slate Vendor Fila Registration” clauss)
§o ~ 050 1084 lloooo0A42Y

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: E n 3’35 Mﬁrl(, LLC

D/BIA - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street $463 Macn Shree ¥ City /il ams o ffe. State Y County e Zip Code }('/2 2‘

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate O NYS SmallBusiness ) NYS Minosity Owned M NYS Woimen Owned
box{es) (check all that apply). # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate 0 Manufactured O Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check all that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %,

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and return this page only.
0 WEARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

)

Bidder's Signature: )6{\/&4«’ PvW\OmJ\f\. (YT Printed or Typed Name: G“’:’J 4 Morc hiors
rie: Prenide ol ose:qfa/acie
Phone: 7]~ 532_ 180 o Extension Toll Free Phone: Extension

Extension Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: @M o (O M.?%gﬂ&d! U.C. ¢aM__ Company Website: l/ww/, en10rqum WL“C.C ora

- FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY o~

[P.R. # 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O QOTHER O MISSING PAGES |

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID

/<




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. General Services Services

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | http:/fnyspra.ogs.ny.gov | customer.service{@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 518-466-5628.

{BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 — NATURAL GAS

DATE: September 13, 2016 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 41:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY — INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 23008 Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 32-34 months based on start date with one two year renewal option. {August 2019)

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)

PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on
behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139 and
§139-k (Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State
Finance Law §139-] (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:

http:/iwww.ogs.ny.goviaboutOgs/requlationsidefaultSFL 139j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax ldentification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
04-3660432 1100166791 .

|Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
M&R Energy Resources Corporation

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code

339 Blooming Grove Tumpike New Windsor NY Orange 12553
If applicable, place an “x"inthe appropriate [ NYS Small Business [ NYS Minority Owned 0 NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply): # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate [ Manufactured [ Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) {check all that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS Qutside NYS %

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
0 WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Si ; ; : : e
s Signature a2 CLAA . [Printed or Typed Name:  Melissa A. Massimi

Title:  CEO/President Date A-BV-lo
Phone:  (845) 534-5462 Extension Toll Free Phone: 1_866-610-7283 Extension

Extension Toll Free Fax Extension
E-mail Address: mmassimi@mandrenergy.com Company Website: www.mandrenergy.com

FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY

|_P.R. # 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES |

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID

/ r,,f”/



NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY. General Services Services

Corning Tower, Empire Stale Plaza, Aibany, NY 12242 | hitp.//nyspro ogs.ny gov | customer.service@ogs.ny gav | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS"” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 518-486-5628.

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 — NATURAL GAS

DATE: September 13, 2016 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 23008 Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: IAs Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 32-34 months based on start date with one two year renewal option. {August 20189}

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on
behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and
§139-k (Procurement Lobbying Law}, and that alf information provided is complate, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State
Finance Law §139- (3) and §139-j {6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:

http:liwww.ogs.ny.qoviaboutOgsirequlations/defaultSFL 139j-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
[ - IHo%q5w loowo 5904

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:

Mdl’-:na.\ ng ﬁe,.m.arm:' Tﬂ&.

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Streat City Stale Caounty Zip Code

"é éau.u'!d“.c_ f—‘\r'.“ D’. A ‘)J-‘g 2w M”‘..M!u'nlI‘ NY i.:-f"- I‘,T'lzl
qlf applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate [ NYS SmallBusiness [  NY$ Minority Owned 0 NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply). # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate = [ Manufactured [0  Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check all that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

Wlf you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
O WE ARE UNABLE TO ID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signalure: / / Y7 Printed or Typed Name:  3,,., 0 Hewe
Title: <. ru. shial Date: 14 / 1/ o

Phone: « ., -1 .o Extension Toll Free Phone: i-%>» 337- 9493  Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: i s ech: m ez @aben cum Company Websile: www . ni7. oo, conm
FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
| P.R.# 23008 LT 0O MEMO O LET O QTHER O MISSING PAGES |

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID

sz




NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE QF

OFPORTUNITY. General Sewﬁces Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany. NY 12242 | hitp /inyspro ogs ny gov | cusiomer service@ogs ny gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 518-486-5628.

"[BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS
DATE: September 13, 2016 (FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY - INDEXED PRICE)
(IFB Number 23008 Classification Code; 15 Utilities
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 32-34 months based on start date with one two year renewal option. (August 2019)
DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)

PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on
behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A
{(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and
§139-k {Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder
affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State
Finance Law §139-j (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:

Bidder's Federal Tax identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See “New York Slate Vendor File Registration” clause)

571212547 1100010714

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Plymouth Rock Energy LLC
D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street 1074 Broadway City Woodmere State NY Counly Nassau Zip Code 11598

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate X0 NYS Small Business O  NYS Minority Owned 0 NYS Women Owned
box{es) (check ali that apply): 80 # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate 0O Manufactured [  Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check ail that apply). Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS 05

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and retumn this page only.
0 WEARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Woam Y

Bidder's Signature: j Printed or Typed Name: David Sokoal
Title: Vice President Date: 8/12/2016
Phone: (516) 634-2151 Extenslon Toll Free Phone: Extension

Extension Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: dsokol@plymouthenergy.com Company Website: www.plymouthenergy.com

] FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY

| P.R.# 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES |

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID
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NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

Carning Tower, Empire State Plaza Albany, NY 12242 | http./inyspro ogs.ny gov | customer service@ogs.ny gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS" CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
Faxed and E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be faxed to 518-486-5628.

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS

DATE: September 13, 2016 {FIRM SUPPLY - FIXED and INDEXED PRICE)
TIME: 11:00 AM (INTERRUPTIBLE SUPPLY — INDEXED PRICE)
IFB Number 23008 Classification Code: 15 Utilities

SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated In the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 32-34 months based on start date with one two year renewal option. {August 2019)

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT.
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on

behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A

(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and

§139-k {Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder

affirms that It understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to parmissible contacts as required by State

Finance Law §139- (3) and §139-j (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at;
http:llwww.ogs.ny.goviaboutOgsirequlations/defaultSFL 139]-k.as

Bidder's Faderal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See “New York State Vendor File Registration” clause)
02-0415440

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding:
Sprague Operating Resources LLC

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code

185 International Drive Portsmouth, NH Rockingham 03801
If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate  [3 NYS Small Business (3 NYS Minority Owned 0 NYS Women Ownéd
box({es) {(check all that apply). # Employees Business Business

it applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate [0 Manufactured [  Solely Manufactured 0O Partially Manufactured
box{es) {(check all that apply). Within NYS Qutside NYS Outside NYS o

If you are not bidding, place an “x™ in the box and return this page only.

O WE ARE UNABLE TO@.[@.TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signature: Printed or Typed Name:
Title: VP & CRO) Date: .
Phone: (03 - Tl 410 Extension Toll Free Phone: | §63 HUL-2843  Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: SSGN’\’IM.M.%.‘QL&WMN ., COm Company Website: W wiw, 3
FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
[P.R. # 23008 LT O MEMO O LET 00 OTHER O ___ MISSING PAGES |

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID




Group 05900 - Natural Gas (Firm Supply - Fixed and Indexed Price)
(Interruptible Supply - Indexed Price)
BID OPENING 09-13-16

BID RESULTS 23008

LOT Direct East Coast Empire M&R National | Plymouth
NUMBER | UTILITY TERRITORY TYPE OF SUPPLY Colonial Energy Power Natural Gas | Energy Mark | Energy Fuel Rock Sprague

1 Central Hudson Indexed Price - Firm Supply $2.1690 $2.2200 $0.9832

2A  [Central Hudson Indexed Price - Firm Supply $2.1430 $1.9270 $2.0452

2B Central Hudson Indexed Price - Interruptible supply NO BID

3A Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Firm Supply NO BID

3B Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Interruptible supply $0.0210 $1.9040 $1.6614 $ 1.1760

4A  [Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Firm Supply $1.8400 $2.1182 $ 1.3760

4B Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Interruptible supply NO BID
5 Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.8430 $0.6846 $ 1.2850 | $1.5500
6 National Fuel Indexed Price - Firm Supply ($0.4000) ($0.3505) | $ 0.2900
7 National Fuel Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.0500 $0.2895 | $ 0.2900
8 National Grid East Gate Indexed Price - Firm Supply $1.6841 ($0.1052) | $ 0.0940

9A  |National Grid East Gate  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $1.3920 $2.5377 $ 4.0630

9B Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply NO BID

9C1 National Grid East Gate |indexed Price - Firm Supply (Nov-Mar) NO BID

9C2 Indexed Price - Interruptible (Apr-Oct) NO BID

10A  [National Grid East Gate  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply (Nov-Mar) $0.9030 $1.5989 | $ 4.0630

10B Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply NO BID

10C1 National Grid East Gate |indexed Price - Firm Supply NO BID

10C2 Indexed Price - Interruptible (Apr-Oct) NO BID
11 National Grid East Gate Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.3130 $3.4828 $ 0.0940 [ ($0.4900)
12 National Grid Long Island |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $1.0076 $ 2.3980
13 National Grid Long Island [Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $0.9281 $ 1.8540
14 National Grid Metro Indexed Price - Firm Supply $1.9925 $ 2.3110 [ $1.1600
15 National Grid West Gate  |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $6.1577 $3.3869 $3.2500 $3.3792 | $ 3.2300
16  [National Grid West Gate  [Indexed Price - Firm Supply ($0.4360) | $2.3429 ($0.2800) ($0.1500) ($0.6495) | $ 0.0940
17 National Grid West Gate  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $3.5825 $0.0573 ($0.1000) ($0.0804) | $ 0.0940
18 NYSEG Fixed Price - Firm Supply $3.7890 $2.8913 | $ 3.7070 | $3.2890
19 NYSEG Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.6000 $ 0.6130
20 NYSEG Indexed Price - Firm Supply ($0.3640) ($0.2500) $0.0899 $ 0.6130
21 NYSEG NO BID
22 RG&E Indexed Price - Firm Supply ($0.1680) $0.3170 $0.1000 $0.0180 $ 0.4840
49 National Grid East Gate Indexed Price - Firm Supply $ 3.2300

23A  [Central Hudson Indexed Price - Firm Supply $2.4980 $2.2680 $2.6701

23B Central Hudson Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply NO BID
24 Central Hudson Fixed Price - Firm Supply $4.7748 $5.5200
25 Central Hudson Indexed Price - Firm Supply $2.6731
26 |Consolidated Edison Fixed Price - Firm Supply $4.1478 $ 45730
27 Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.8430 $0.6846 $ 1.2850 $0.9790
28  |Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $1.4010 $1.2608 $ 1.1760
29 Consolidated Edison Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $1.6420 $2.1111 $ 1.1760
30 National Fuel Fixed Price - Firm Supply $3.2000 $3.4980 | $ 3.4990
31 National Fuel Indexed Price - Firm Supply ($0.2470) ($0.3400) ($0.3537)| $ 0.2900
32 National Fuel Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.1500 $0.2993 | $ 0.2900
33 National Fuel Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply ($0.3400) ($0.3883)
34 National Grid East Gate Fixed Price - Firm Supply $6.9055 $3.3745 | $ 3.2300 $2.8900
35 National Grid East Gate Indexed Price - Firm Supply $1.6841 ($0.1985)| $ 0.0940 ($0.5500)
36 National Grid East Gate Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $2.5220 $ 3.8630
37 National Grid Metro Fixed Price - Firm Supply $5.2518 $ 5.4880 $2.6800
38 National Grid Metro Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $1.7646 $ 1.1530
39 National Grid West Gate  |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $6.1577 $3.3869 $3.2500 $2.9236 | $ 3.2300
40 National Grid West Gate  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply ($0.3200) $2.5245 ($0.1500) ($0.5446)| $ 0.0940
41 National Grid West Gate  |Indexed Price - Firm Supply $3.5825 $0.0573 ($0.1500) ($0.3110)| $ 0.0940
42 National Grid West Gate  [Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $3.6506 ($0.0100) $0.1319 | $ 3.8630
43 NYSEG Fixed Price - Firm Supply $3.6300 $3.8607 | $ 3.7070 $3.2890
44 NYSEG Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.1500 $ 0.6130
45 NYSEG Indexed Price - Firm Supply ($0.5878)| $ 0.6130
46 NYSEG Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $0.7600 $0.5638
47 Orange & Rockland Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.6830 $0.8260 $0.9410 $0.6520 $ 1.3500
48 Orange & Rockland Indexed Price - Interruptible Supply $0.1100 $0.3590 $0.9862 $0.4800 $ 1.3300
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