Bid Opening Results For:

IFB NUMBER 23009
BID OPENING 11/8/2016
GROUP NUMBER 05900

PURCHASING OFFICER  Bryant Kirk

TELEPHONE (518) 402-3021

DESCRIPTION

Natural Gas
(Statewide)




NEW YORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF

OPPORTUNITY G eneral se I‘Vi ces Services

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp:/inyspro.ogs.ny gov | customer service@ogs ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS" CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be E-mailad to

0GS.sm.P5_CM_FleetFuelRoads OGS.sm.PS CM FieetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 — NATURAL GAS

DATE: November 8, 2016 Re-Bid on LOTS 11,18,19,44 & 49 from IFB 23008
TIME: 11:00 AM

IFB Number 23009 Classification Code: 15 Fuels & Lubricants
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2017-8/31/2019

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
Jamas Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executad by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on

behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A

{Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and

§139-k (Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Biddar

affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State

Finance Law §139-j {3) and §139- (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:
hitp:/iwww.ogs.ny.goviaboutOgsiregulations/defaultSFL 139j-k.as

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number;
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See "New York Stale Vendor File Registration” clause)
16-1352123 1000047921

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: Empire Natural Gas Corporation

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code

178 Airport Road Greene NY Chenango 13778
If applicable, piace an “x" in the appropriate (@ NYS SmallBusiness O  NYS Minority Owned | NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply): 7, # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate [ Manufactured O  Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) {check alf that apply): Within NYS Qutside NYS Outside NYS %

If you are not bidding, place an X" in the box and return this page only.
O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signature: Printed or Typed Name: Seth R. Barrows
Titie: President %ﬂ‘&/ﬂ Date: 11/07/2016

Phone: (607) 656-7851 Extension Toll Free Phone: 888-659-8967 Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax: {607) 656-7854 Extension
E-mail Address: seth@empirenalgas.com Company Website: empirenatgas.com
FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
| P.R.# 23008 LT 8 MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID
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NEWYORK | Office of Procurement
creorrn | Caneral Services Services

Invitation For Bids
IMPORTANT: SEE "NOTICE TO BIDDERS" CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be E-mailed to
0GS.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads 0GS.sm.PS CM FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.gov
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BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS

DATE: November 8, 2016 Re-Bid on LOTS 11,18,19,44 & 49 from IFB 23008
TIME: 11:00 AM

IFB Number 23009 Classification Code: 15 Fuels & Lubricants
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2017-8/31/2019

___ DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authaority to sign on

hehalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A

(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139- and

§139+ (Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder

affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State

Finance Law §139+ (3) and §139-] (6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:
http:fiwww.ogs.ny.gov/aboutOgsirequlations/defaultSFL _139j-k.as

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
_ (Do Not Use Social Security Number) {Ses "New York State Vendor File Registration” clauss)
5911242 597] LooOt o 7{H
Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: )
Plymoudn Rock Cera
D/B/A - Doing Business As {if applicable): ) U

sn-eet,\o,{ L.\ 8 (OQA‘WQ_U‘ City me&&Stata N\{ County NOS:.Q W Zip Code l \ 5 q?

If applicable, place an *x" in the apprbpriate % NYS Small Business O  NYS Minority Owned ] NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply): # Employees Business Business

if applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate [ Manufactured O Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check all that apply). Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %%

If you are not bidding, place an “x” in the box and return this page only.
O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

Bidder's Signature: A\ = Printed or Typed Name:  ¥1)5}, @M K.pl‘.s)"
Tite: /7 - - Cpnolizsw pate: |} /7/ /4
Phone: ¢ Extension Toll Free'Phdne: 471 4 2y 3\-43:5’ Extension
Extension Toll Free Fax: Extension
|E-mail Address: £ Lol I\/(f,’-) Plyn 27 &N fam Company Website: [7 )\l .0.-0:¢ V7 émn
o Fe FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY e
{ P.R.# 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O OTHER O MISSING PAGES ]

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID ORNO-BID _—""2



NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

JE OF

Corning Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | hitp:/inyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer.service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS" CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be E-mailed to

OGS.sm.PS_CM_FlestFuelRoads OGS.sm.PS CM_FleetFuelRoads@ogs.ny.qov
BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 - NATURAL GAS
DATE: November 8, 2016 Re-Bid on LOTS 11,18,19,44 & 49 from IFB 23008
TIME: 11:00 AM
IFB Number 23009 Classification Code: 15 Fuels & Lubricants
{SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: lAs Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2017-8/31/2019

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)

PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on

behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A

(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §1394 and

§139-k (Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder

affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State

Finance Law §139-j (3} and §139-j {6) (b}). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:
http:/iwww.ogs.nv.aoviaboutOgs/requlations/defaultSFL 138]-k.asp

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
{Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See "New York State Vendor File Registration” clausa)
§oos0 /054 [loo00 24 2.8

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: &
ergyMocke (L
D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable): =

Street 6653 Mon'n S”"’E& + Cityh/l ”'MIWI l[f. State ‘Uy County EI‘I'L Zip Code ’u{a&j

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriale [ NYS Small Business [  NYS Minority Owned O NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply). # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an *x” in the appropriate [ Manufactured [  Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check all that appiy): Within NYS Jutside NYS Dutside NYS %

If you are not bidding, place an "x" in the box and retumn this page only.
O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME BECAUSE:

77 . ] , A
Bidder's Signature: % Yz /4 /d /’Lﬁ/ U‘l{ Printed or Typed Name: Gafg A Mm/.;b/‘r'
Title: Pf‘c,s.‘ofuv'-/y pate: _Jj|7 ’IL

Phone. J1b- 32 —1900 Extension Toll Free Phone: Extension
Extangion Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: gMgﬂg%gM “ t.(gm  Company Website: Ww/w/, Mgcgg QQCE { ! C.Com
_FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY _
[P.R.# 23008 LT O MEMO O LET O OTHER D MISSING PAGES |

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID

/



NEWYORK | Office of Procurement
OPPORTUNITY. Generaﬂ sewﬁces Services

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | http://nyspro.ogs.ny.gov | customer service@ogs.ny.gov | 518-474-6717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY
E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be E-mailed to

0GS.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads OGS.sm.PS CM FleetFuelRoadsfogs.nv.qov
BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05900 — NATURAL GAS
DATE: November 8, 2016 Re-Bid on LOTS 11,18,19,44 & 49 from IFB 23008
IME: 11:00 AM
(IFB Number 23009 [Classification Code: 15 Fuels & Lubricants
|SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

ONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2017-8/31/2019

DESIGNATED CONTACTS: {see section 1.6)

PRIMARY CONTACT. SECONDARY CONTACT:
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on

behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A

(Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139-j and

§139-k {Procurement Lobbying Law), and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate. By signing, Bidder

affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State

Finance Law §139- (3) and §139-] {6) (b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at;
hitp:llwww.ogs.ny.gov/aboutOgsiregulations/defauitSFL 13%j-k.as

Bidder's Faederal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor Identification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) {See “New York Stale Vendor File Regisiration® clause)
80-0908818

Lagal Business Name of Company Bidding: Direct Energy Business Marketing LLC

|D/BIA - Doing Business As (if applicable):

Street City State County Zip Code

194 Wood Avenue South Iselin NJ Middilesex 08830
|if applicable, place an "X™ in the appropriate [ NYS SmallBusiness O  NYS Minority Owned ] NYS Women Owned
box{es) (check all that apply). # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an “x” in the appropriate  [J Manufactured QO  Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box(es) (check all that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

lIf you are not bidding, place an *x” in and retumn this page only.
O WE ARE UNABLE,TO Bl THIS FIME BECAUSE:

|Bidder's Signatuséz Printed or Typed Name:  mark Taddeo, VP Direct Sales

Title: Mark Taddeo, Date: November 2, 2016

Phone: .., ., s-azs‘ky Extension Toll Free Phone: Extension
Extansion Toll Free Fax: Extension
E-mail Address: Victoria.Dyckman@directenergy.com Company Website:
i — FOR NEW YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY
[P.R-# 23008 LT_O MEMO O LET O __ OTHER O___ MISSING PAGES

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID



NEWYORK | Office of Procurement

STATE OF . -
OPPORTUNITY. General Serv'ces Services

Coming Tower, Empire State Plaza, Albany, NY 12242 | http./inyspro.ogs ny gov | customer service@ogs.ny gov | 518-474-86717

Invitation For Bids

IMPORTANT: SEE “NOTICE TO BIDDERS” CLAUSES HEREIN
BIDS MAY BE SENT TO THE ABOVE ADDRESS ONLY

E-mail Bid Submissions are not accepted with the exception of pricing which can be E-mailed to

0GS.sm.PS_CM_FleetFuelRoads 0GS.sm.PS CM_FleetFuslRoads@ogs.ny.qov

BID OPENING TITLE: Group 05800 - NATURAL GAS

DATE: November 8, 2016 Re-Bid on LOTS 11,18,19,44 & 49 from IFB 23008
TIME: 11:00 AM

IFB Number 23009 Classification Code: 15 Fuels & Lubricants
SPECIFICATION REFERENCE: As Incorporated in the Invitation For Bids

CONTRACT PERIOD: 1/1/2017-8/31/201%
DESIGNATED CONTACTS: (see section 1.6)
PRIMARY CONTACT: SECONDARY CONTACT.
James Patrick Bryant Kirk

The bid must be fully and properly executed by an authorized person. By signing, you certify your express authority to sign on

behalf of yourself, your company, or other entity, and full knowledge and acceptance of this INVITATION FOR BIDS, Appendix A

{Standard Clauses For New York State Contracts), Appendix B (OGS General Specifications), and State Finance Law §139- and

§138-k {Procurement Lobbying Law}, and that all information provided is complete, true and accurate, By signing, Bidder

affirms that it understands and agrees to comply with the OGS procedures relative to permissible contacts as required by State

Finance Law §139-j (3) and §139-j (6) {b). Additional Procurement Lobbying information may be accessed at:
http:/iwww.ogs.ny.goviaboutOgs/requlations/defaultSFL 139j-k.as

Bidder's Federal Tax Identification Number: NYS Vendor ldentification Number:
(Do Not Use Social Security Number) (See "New York Stale Vendor Fife Regisiration” clause)
G/- 1065157 O o680 /8339

Legal Business Name of Company Bidding: . -
S?lq”cﬁ J e{g/,,- Corlpco-’q 'L @7

D/B/A - Doing Business As (if applicable);

Street . City = _ State County . Zip Code

/077 Celestal S,  Corconds o Ko St YIRO R
If applicable, place an “x" in the appropriate [ NYS Small Business [J  NYS Minority Owned D NYS Women Owned
box(es) (check all that apply): # Employees Business Business

If applicable, place an *x" in the appropriate 0O Manufactured 0 Solely Manufactured O Partially Manufactured
box{es) (check ali that apply): Within NYS Outside NYS Outside NYS %

If you are not bidding, place an “x" in the box and raturn thns page only,
O WE ARE UNABLE TO BID AT THIS TIME B

—————l

Bidder's Signature;k//a Dy Printed or Typed Name: £ gwrC-c@ /70674
e fxecks Ve’ fes.ded e 10 J20 L
Phone: $73 G211 3 Extension . Toll Free Phone: oo -__’;Q& -0 ¢ Extension

Extension Tel-RreaFax <£23-G&/-3773  Extension
E-mail Address: /promq q@s‘fq .J Cary, . Co-n Company Website: w.u /. g.Ja..?qu v . oa"

FOR i{éﬁ YORK STATE PROCUREMENT USE ONLY

[ P.R.# 23008 UT O MEMO O LET O OTHER 0O MISSING PAGES i

RETURN THIS PAGE AS PART OF BID OR NO-BID '



Group 05900 - Natural Gas (Firm Supply - Fixed and Indexed Price) (firm supply)

Attachment 1 Price Page 1 - Award start date 1-1-2017

IFB 23009 pricing evaluation

Empire
LOT Direct | Natural| Energy | National [Plymouth| Stand

NUMBER [UTILITY TERRITORY TYPE OF SUPPLY Energy Gas Mark Fuel Rock Energy

11 National Grid East Gate |Indexed Price - Firm Supply

18 NYSEG / North Country |Fixed Price - Firm Supply $3.4710 $3.5103 | $4.2600

19 NYSEG / Iriquios Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.6250

43 NYSEG / Dominion Fixed Price - Firm Supply $3.5140 | $3.5800 | $3.5927 $3.5500

44 NYSEG / Tennessee Indexed Price - Firm Supply $1.1830 | $0.1000

49 National Grid Long Island|Fixed Price - Firm Supply $4.4600

50 NYSEG / Columbia Fixed Price - Firm Supply $4.8240 | $4.2700 | $5.0814 $3.8500

51 NYSEG / Dominion Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.1230 | $0.2400 | ($0.1412) $0.3500

52 NYSEG / Columbia Indexed Price - Firm Supply $1.1220 | $0.8600 | $1.2624 | $0.5300 | $0.6500

53 NYSEG / Dominion Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.0270 | ($0.1500) | ($0.5200) ($0.3000)

54 NYSEG / Tennessee Indexed Price - Firm Supply | $0.1900 |$1.0830 | ($0.0100) [ $0.0364 $0.1250

55 RG&E Indexed Price - Firm Supply $0.3930 | $0.5100 | $0.4809

**%** The preceding prices are submissions only
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