














23013 Transit Buses Bid Summary

LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Conventional Style Conventional Style
Low Floor 

(Front Engine)

Low Floor 

(Rear Engine)

Bidder (#) Bidder Name
24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Bid Summary Alliance Bus Group $2,468,000.00 $7,691,025.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (2) EMPIRE BUS SALES, No Bid No Bid $5,215,630.00 $6,912,222.00

Bid Summary (3) Matthews Buses Inc. $2,348,300.00 $7,297,485.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (4) Enter Bidder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (5) New York Bus Sales, $2,965,665.00 $9,412,875.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (6) W.N.Y. Bus Parts, Inc.     $2,353,571.05 $7,286,906.40 No Bid No Bid

Bid Rank Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name

1 $2,348,300.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $7,286,906.40 W.N.Y. Bus Parts, Inc.     

Dba Gorman 

Enterprises

$5,215,630.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

$6,912,222.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

2 $2,353,571.05 W.N.Y. Bus Parts, Inc.     

Dba Gorman 

Enterprises

$7,297,485.00 Matthews Buses Inc.

3 $2,468,000.00 Alliance Bus Group $7,691,025.00 Alliance Bus Group

4 $2,965,665.00 New York Bus Sales, 

LLC / J.P. Bus & Truck 

Repair LTD D/B/A 

Bird Bus Sales

$9,412,875.00 New York Bus Sales, 

LLC / J.P. Bus & Truck 

Repair LTD D/B/A 

Bird Bus Sales

LOT M

Low Floor (Rear Engine)

35  Passenger [33A/2WC]

Grand Total For Lot

LOT LLOT K

25 Passenger [23A/2WC]28 Passenger [26A/2WC]

Low Floor (Front Engine)Conventional Style

LOT J

Conventional Style 

24 Passenger [22A/2WC]



23013 Transit Buses Bid Summary

LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Conventional Style Conventional Style
Low Floor 

(Front Engine)

Low Floor 

(Rear Engine)

Bidder (#) Bidder Name
24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Bid Summary Alliance Bus Group $2,468,000.00 $7,691,025.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (2) EMPIRE BUS SALES, No Bid No Bid $5,215,630.00 $6,912,222.00

Bid Summary (3) Matthews Buses Inc. $2,348,300.00 $7,297,485.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (4) Enter Bidder No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (5) New York Bus Sales, $2,965,665.00 $9,412,875.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary (6) W.N.Y. Bus Parts, Inc.     $2,353,571.05 $7,286,906.40 No Bid No Bid

Bid Rank Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name Grand Total For Lot Bidder Name

1 $2,348,300.00 Matthews Buses Inc. $7,286,906.40 W.N.Y. Bus Parts, Inc.     

Dba Gorman 

Enterprises

$5,215,630.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

$6,912,222.00 EMPIRE BUS SALES, 

LLC

2 $2,353,571.05 W.N.Y. Bus Parts, Inc.     

Dba Gorman 

Enterprises

$7,297,485.00 Matthews Buses Inc.

3 $2,468,000.00 Alliance Bus Group $7,691,025.00 Alliance Bus Group

4 $2,965,665.00 New York Bus Sales, 

LLC / J.P. Bus & Truck 

Repair LTD D/B/A 

Bird Bus Sales

$9,412,875.00 New York Bus Sales, 

LLC / J.P. Bus & Truck 

Repair LTD D/B/A 

Bird Bus Sales

LOT M

Low Floor (Rear Engine)

35  Passenger [33A/2WC]

Grand Total For Lot

LOT LLOT K

25 Passenger [23A/2WC]28 Passenger [26A/2WC]

Low Floor (Front Engine)Conventional Style

LOT J

Conventional Style 

24 Passenger [22A/2WC]



GROUP 40523-23013, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 02/08/2016)

Alliance Bus Group

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description Conventional Style Conventional Style 
Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
YES YES NO NO

Chassis Model Year 2016 2016 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Freightliner Custom ChassisFreightliner Custom Chassis Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model S2C S2C Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year 2016 2016 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Startrans Startrans Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model President/PS2 President/PS2 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code 59004 59005 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price $115,000.00 119000 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price $168,000.00 $551,025.00 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot $2,468,000.00 $7,691,025.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT J") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit Price or 

one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot shall deem the 

bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-23013, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (01/12/2016)

EMPIRE BUS SALES, LLC

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description Conventional Style Conventional Style 
Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
NO NO YES YES

Chassis Model Year Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab 2016 2016

Chassis Make Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab IC (International) ELDORADO

Chassis Model Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab TC EZ-RIDER II MAX

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab NA 35

Body Model Year Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab 2016 2016

Body Make Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Eldorado National ELDORADO

Body Model Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Passport EZ-RIDER II MAX

Body Model Code Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab 35HD 35

Evaluation Quantity 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab $237,038.00 $326,243.00

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab $474,870.00 $387,362.00

Grand Total For Lot No Bid No Bid $5,215,630.00 $6,912,222.00

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT J") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit Price or 

one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot shall deem the 

bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-23013, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 02/08/2016)

Matthews Buses Inc.

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description Conventional Style Conventional Style 
Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
YES YES NO NO

Chassis Model Year 2017 2017 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Freightliner Custom ChassisFreightliner Custom Chassis Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model S2C S2C Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year 2017 2017 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Champion Champion Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Defender Defender Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code S2C S2C Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price $111,730.00 115051 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price $113,700.00 $394,425.00 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot $2,348,300.00 $7,297,485.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT J") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit Price or 

one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot shall deem the 

bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-23013, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (01/12/2016)

Enter Bidder Company Name on Attach 1 

Summary worksheet

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description Conventional Style Conventional Style 
Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
NO NO YES YES

Chassis Model Year Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab 2016

Chassis Make Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab New Flyer

Chassis Model Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MiDi

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MD35

Body Model Year Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab 2016

Body Make Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab New Flyer

Body Model Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MiDi

Body Model Code Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab MD35

Evaluation Quantity 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab $314,812.57

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT J") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit Price or 

one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot shall deem the 

bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-23013, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 02/08/2016)

New York Bus Sales, LLC / J.P. Bus & Truck 

Repair LTD D/B/A Bird Bus Sales

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description Conventional Style Conventional Style 
Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
YES YES NO NO

Chassis Model Year 2017 2017 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make Blue Bird Blue Bird Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model BBCV BBCV Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code 2610 3011 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year 2017 2017 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make Blue Bird Blue Bird Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model BBCV BBCV Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code 2610 3011 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price $129,991.00 133864 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price $365,845.00 $1,381,035.00 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot $2,965,665.00 $9,412,875.00 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT J") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit Price or 

one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot shall deem the 

bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 



GROUP 40523-23013, BUSES, TRANSIT (Adult Passenger)                               Attachment 1: Specifications and Price Pages (Revised 02/08/2016)

W.N.Y. Bus Parts, Inc.     Dba Gorman 

Enterprises

Tab name of the Bidder input 

worksheet applicable to the Lot
LOT J LOT K LOT L LOT M

Lot/Item Description Conventional Style Conventional Style 
Low Floor (Front 

Engine)

Low Floor (Rear 

Engine)

Minimum Passenger Capacity 

[Ambulatory (A) plus Wheelchairs (WC)]

24 Passenger 

[22A/2WC]

28 Passenger 

[26A/2WC]

25 Passenger 

[23A/2WC]

35  Passenger 

[33A/2WC]

Select "YES" from the drop-down 

menu to bid on a Lot
YES YES NO NO

Chassis Model Year 2016 2016 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Make FORD FORD Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model F650 F650 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Chassis Model Code Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Year 2016 2016 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Make GLAVAL GLAVAL Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model CONCORDE II CONCORDE II Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Body Model Code Enter on LOT J tab Enter on LOT K tab Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Evaluation Quantity 20 60 20 20

Base Item Unit Price $110,901.45 113121.08 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Total Optional Equipment Evaluation Price $135,542.05 $499,641.60 Enter on LOT L tab Enter on LOT M tab

Grand Total For Lot $2,353,571.05 $7,286,906.40 No Bid No Bid

Bid Summary
To enter a bid for a Lot, (1) select "YES" from the drop-down menu in Row 9 below for the applicable Lot on this worksheet, and (2) complete the Bidder input worksheet for the Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). 

Additional instructions are on the "Instructions" tab.

Cells on this worksheet, and Bidder input cells on the Bidder input worksheets (e.g., "LOT J") will be black until "YES" is selected in Row 9 for the applicable Lot on this worksheet. 

If "No Bid" appears in the "Grand Total For Lot" Row below (Row 21), that indicates that the Bidder has failed to enter all required pricing information (e.g., the Base Item Unit Price or 

one or more Optional Equipment Unit Price) on the Bidder input worksheet for the applicable Lot (e.g., "LOT J"). Failure to enter all required pricing information for a Lot shall deem the 

bid for that Lot non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the bid for that Lot. 
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